*Quote Nbr	Creation Date	Due Date	Page	
2335-4767-75	12/01/2022		1 of 30	
Payment	Terms	Deliver	y Terms	
NET 30	DAYS	DE	ST	
Valio	d To	Prepar	ed By	
12/31/	2022	SCURTI,	BRITTANY	
Customer I	Reference	Sales Rep	presentative	
RFQ REQTE 2	2152-1346-81	RONALD SHERDEL		
To place an order	Ph: 800-766-7000	Fx: 800-926-1166		
Submit	ted To:	Customer Account	t: 374633-070	
TIFFANY MORAND MORANDT@HHMI.OR 301-215-8589	G	HHMI UMBC DEPT 1000 HILLTOP CIF BALTIMORE MD 2 ATTN: RFQ	RCLE	



FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LLC 4500 TURNBERRY DRIVE HANOVER PARK IL 60133-5491

Review and Place Order

Click here or go through your purchasing system to fishersci.com quotes

*Please reference this Quote Number on all correspondence.

Don't have a profile? Register on fishersci.com

For complete Terms and Conditions, please click here.

Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1	EA	46cm, 18 in., samples	ALUMINUM FOIL 18IN X 50FT Aluminum Foil, Length: 50 ft., Thickness: 0.024mm, Width: Applications: For sealing, weighing, and transferring og # 75SQ.FT being sold as 1 per each	25.32	25.32
2	1	PK	01 812 51	POUCH SSL AUTOCL 3.5X9IN 200PK	67.57	67.57
			Width: 9cm, 3 Thickness: 2 Vendor Catal Shelf Life 3Y			
3	1	CS	FB02911761	JAR CLR ST SD W/PTFE 16OZ 12CS	59.75	59.75
			Caps, Capac Quantity: 12, Yes, Closure Vendor Catal	Clear Straight Sided Glass Jars with White Polypropylene ity: 480 mL, 16 oz., Closure Liner: PE Foam/PTFE, Glass (Type 3), Closure Color: White, Closure Included: Material: Polypropylene, Neck Finish: 89-400 og # W014216 eing sold as 12 each per case		

Nbr

4

5

6

Qty

1

NOBID

1

UN

ΕA

ΡK

-



38.72

35.47

Quote Nbr **Customer Reference** Page RFQ REQTE 2152-1346-81 2335-4767-75 2 of 30 Unit Extended **Catalog Number** Description Price Price 04 355 16 **BACDOWN HANDSOAP 1 LITER** 38.72 Decon Bacdown Hand Soap, Size: 34 oz., 1L, Packaging: Bottle, one pump, Boiling Point: >212 deg.F, Format: Liquid, For Use With: For laboratory personnel, Fragrance: Almond, pH Range: 7.2, Quantity: Each, Recommended Applications: Safety Vendor Catalog # 7001 This item is being sold as 1 per each *--NO BID--* TUBES 1.5ML NATURAL 500/PK 05 402 35.47 Eppendorf Snap-Cap Microcentrifuge Flex-Tube Tubes, Natural, Max. Force: 30000xG, Packaging: 500/Pk., Autoclavable: Yes, Capacity: 1.5mL, Diameter Outer: 10mm, Graduated: Yes, Length: 38mm, Polypropylene, Non-sterile, Cap Style: Snap Cap, Closure Type: Snap Vendor Catalog # 022364111 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack

7	1	CS	06 443 18	FB50MLTBE PP\FLAT\GRD\S 500CS	165.79	165.79
			Fisherb	rand Higher-Speed 50mL Easy Reader Plastic Centrifuge Tubes,		
			Closure	Type: Flat Cap, Packaging: Rack, Capacity: 1.69 oz., 50mL,		
			Gradua	tions: Yes, Includes: Black graduations, PP (Polypropylene),		
		0	Sterile,	Diameter Outside: 1.1 in., 28mm, Label Type: White Marking		
			Spot, Le	ength: 115mm		
			Vendor	Catalog # 431263		
			Shelf Li	•		
			This iter	n is being sold as 500 each per case		
8	1	PK	05 529C	CENTRIFUGE TUBE PC 50ML 10/PK	56.44	56.44
		-	The sume of	Calentific Nalsona Oak Bidge Lligh Creed Dalysaghanata		

8	1	PK	05 529C	CENTRIFUGE TUBE PC 50ML 10/PK	56.44	56.44
			Centrifuge Outside: 2 (Polycarb Bottom Sl Vendor C	cientific Nalgene Oak Ridge High-Speed Polycarbonate Tubes, 50mL, With screw caps; Capacity: 50mL, Diameter 88.8mm, Autoclavable: Yes, Graduations: None, PC onate), No. per Pack: 10, Non-sterile, Writing Area: No, hape: Round, Closure: Included atalog # 3118-0050 is being sold as 10 each per pack		
9	1	CS	05 539 12	15M TBE PP/FLT/ST/GRD RK500CS	174.03	174.03
			Capacity:	nd Easy Reader Conical Polypropylene Centrifuge Tubes, 15mL, 0.50 oz., Closure Type: Flat Cap, Packaging: Racked, ear, Graduations: 0.5mL, Includes: Black graduations, PP		

aduations: 0.5mL, includes: Black graduations, Pr (Polypropylene), No. per Pack: 50, Diameter Outside: 0.7 in., 17mm,



					Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	e	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-134	46-81	3 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Vendor Catalog	ite Marking Spot # 430885 ng sold as 500 e				
10	1	PK	3.8cm), Assorter Autoclavable, Ye mm, Includes: R Vendor Catalog	Well PCR Tube I d (Blue, Green, C es, Polypropylen Removable, hinge	Drange, Pink, Yello e, PCR Rack, Dep ed lid	5 in. H (12.7 x 10.1 x	45.14	45.14
11	1	CS	Membrane Mate 54.5cm2, Volum Disposable: Yes Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 3Y	able Vacuum Filt erial: Cellulose Ad ne Receiver: 1000 s	cetate, Volume: 50 0mL, Connectors:	s, Pore Size: 0.2um, 0mL, Filtration Area:	155.09	155.09
12	1	CS	0.22 um, Volum 50 mL polypropy stands, orange I Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 3Y	uge Tube Top Va e: 150 mL, Incluo ylene receiver ce HDPE plug seal,	des: 150 mL polys entrifuge tube, two Polystyrene, Cellu	Nembrane, Pore Size: yrene filter funnel, centrifuge tube	57.19	57.19
13	1	PK	Filter Material: F MBS/Polypropyl Connectors: Do cm, Diameter M Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 2Y	Steriflip Sterile Di Polyethersulfone ene, Polyethersu uble lead thread embrane: 6.4 cm	50ML 0.22UM 25 isposable Vacuum (PES), Pore Size: ulfone, Volume: 50 with vacuum port, n, Disposable: Yes ach per pack	Filter Units, 0.22 um, mL, Clear,	119.86	119.86



						-		
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 215	2-1346-81	4 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
14	1	РК	Diameter: 110 Porosity: 6um Description: G 110 mm Vendor Catalo	an Qualitative Gra mm, Format: Circ , Filter Paper, Airfl rade 3 Qualitative	eles, Grade: Grade ow Rate: 26sec./10 Filter Paper Stand	nd Sheets - Grade 3, 3, Cellulose, 00mL/sq. in.,	27.69	27.69
15	1	РК	Dimensions: 8 Graduations: 0 on each strip, Quantity: 100F Vendor Catalo	an pH Indicator Pa 0 x 6mm, Color Bo 0.5 pH units, Includ complementary in Pack	onded, pH Test Str des: Plastic suppor dicator charts, Len	H Range: 4.5 to 10, ip, Format: Strip, ts, paper segments	24.33	24.33
16	1	PK	Pore Size: 0.2 25 mm Sterile Disposable: Y Vendor Catalo	an GD/X Sterile P um, Autoclavable:	Yes, Volume: >10 S filtration medium : 4.6 cm2	Diameter: 25 mm, mL, Description: GD/X	245.31	245.31
17	1	CS	250 mL, Boros Description: T Use With: Idea Style: Narrow Vendor Catalo	w Mouth Erlenmey silicate Glass, Bott op style: Tooled, E al for shaker cultur	om Shape: Bafflec Diameter Outer: 3.3 res, Height: 6.1 in.,	vith Baffles, Capacity: , Closure Size: 6, 8 in., 85 mm, For	201.61	201.67
18	1	CS	Baffled Botton Closure Size: per Pack: 1, S	tific Nalgene Singl n: Sterile, 250mL, v 38-430 mm, Closu	vented, Capacity: 2	meyer Flasks with 250 mL, 8 oz., per Case: 12, No.	159.25	159.25

Nbr

19

20

21

22

23

Quote Nbr



Customer Reference

Page

136.50

26.08

73.10

RFQ REQTE 2152-1346-81 2335-4767-75 5 of 30 Unit Extended UN Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price This item is being sold as 12 each per case 1 CS 10 531 FLSK PETG BAF 500 VENT 12/CS 200.90 200.90 Thermo Scientific Nalgene Single-Use PETG Erlenmeyer Flasks with Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 500mL, vented, Capacity: 500 mL, 16 oz., Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Closure Type: Vent, No. per Case: 12, No. per Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmeyer, Surface Coating: None Vendor Catalog # 4116-0500 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 12 each per case CS 10 532 FLSK PETG BAF 1000 VENT 6/CS 136.50 1 Thermo Scientific Nalgene Single-Use PETG Erlenmeyer Flasks with Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 1000mL, vented, Capacity: 1000 mL, 32 oz., Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Closure Type: Vent, No. per Case: 6, No. per Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmeyer, Surface Coating: None Vendor Catalog # 4116-1000 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 6 each per case CS 2 10 533 FLSK PETG BAF 2000 VENT 4/CS 104.65 209.30 Thermo Scientific Nalgene Single-Use PETG Erlenmeyer Flasks with Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 2000mL, vented, Capacity: 2000 mL, 64 oz., Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Closure Type: Vent, No. per Case: 4, No. per Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmeyer, Surface Coating: None Vendor Catalog # 4116-2000 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 4 each per case ΡK 11 312A GLASS BEADS SOLID 3MM 1LB/PK 26.08 Walter Stern Economical Solid Glass Beads for Distillation Columns, Diameter: 3 mm Vendor Catalog # 100C This item is being sold as 1 per pack 12 007 HOODED GAS LIGHTER 73.10 1 CS Fisherbrand Shurlite Safety Gas Lighters, For Use With: Capable of lighting any flammable gas Vendor Catalog # 3001 This item is being sold as 10 each per case



Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	Page
2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-1346-81	6 of 30

Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price
24	2	CS	Fisherbrand Sterile Polys Magnifier Stripe, Volume	GTER 2ML(0.01GRAD)500/CS tyrene Disposable Serological Pipets with 2 mL, 0.06 oz., Bulk, Tolerance: +/-0.04 0.01 mL, Calibration: To Deliver/Blow Out 5 500 each per case	76.80	153.60
25	2	CS	Fisherbrand Sterile Polys Magnifier Stripe, Volume		59.12	118.24
26	1	CS	Fisherbrand Sterile Polys Magnifier Stripe, Volume		22.81	22.81
27	1	CS	Fisherbrand Sterile Polys Magnifier Stripe, Volume		23.89	23.89
28	1	CS	Eppendorf Combitips Adv Volume: 2.5mL, Color Co	39553	168.48	168.48



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	2-1346-81	7 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
29	1	EA	6 in. (10 x 10 :	luminum Baskets x 15.2cm), Autocla , Height: 6 in., 15.2 og # 1380710	ASKET 4X4X6IN with Tilt-Top Lids, avable: Not Autocla 2 cm, Length: 4 in., er each		33.01	33.01
30	1	EA	6 in. (10 x 10 :	luminum Baskets x 15.2cm), Autocla , Height: 6 in., 15.2 og # 1380710	ASKET 4X4X6IN with Tilt-Top Lids, avable: Not Autocla 2 cm, Length: 4 in., er each		33.01	33.01
31	1	EA	(25 x 15 x 15.	luminum Baskets 2cm), Autoclavable in., 15.2 cm, Leng og # 1380722		nsions: 10 x 6 x 6 in. e, Closure Included: Vidth: 6 in., 15 cm	46.10	46.10
32	1	PK	510mm), Qua 610mm, Width keep spills fro Vendor Catalo	bsorbent Underpantity: 50 Pack, Abs	ethylene	4 x 20 in. (610 x	27.83	27.83
33	1	РК	Not Autoclava Dimensions: 4 in., 7.3 cm, Le in., 7.8 cm	ienceware Microce ble, Holds: 1.5mL 1.68 x 3.06 x 2.93 i ength: 4.68 in., 11.9 og # F18876-0000	Tubes, Positions: . in. (11.9 x 7.8 x 7.3 9 cm, Quantity: 4/F	Rack, Autoclavable: 24, Microtube Rack, 8cm), Height: 2.93	53.40	53.40



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	rence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	-1346-81	8 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
34	1	EA	Manufacturing White, For Use 20 mm Tubes, Rack Unwire V	tific Nalgene Unw Technology, for 2 e With: 20mm Tub Acetal Plastic, Po Wht 20mm og # 5970-0020	E TEST TUBE WH ire Test Tube Rack 20mm tubes, white, bes, Autoclavable: A psitions: 40, Descri er each	s: Resmer Array: 4 x 10, Autoclavable, Holds:	38.22	38.22
35	1	EA	Manufacturing For Use With: Tubes, Acetal Unwire Wht 30 Vendor Catalo	tific Nalgene Unw Technology, for 3 30mm Tubes, Au	toclavable: Autocla 24, Description: To bening: 30 mm	s: Resmer Array: 3 x 8, White, /able, Holds: 30 mm	40.56	40.56
36	1	EA	14 809 31	RACK UNWIR	E ACETAL ORG 20	MM	38.22	38.22
			Manufacturing Orange, For U 20 mm Tubes, Rack Unwire O Vendor Catalo	Technology, for 2 se With: 20mm T Acetal Plastic, Pe	ositions: 40, Descri	e, Array: 4 x 10, Autoclavable, Holds:		
37	1	EA	Manufacturing Orange, For U 30 mm Tubes, Rack Unwire (tific Nalgene Unw Technology, for 3 se With: 30mm T Acetal Plastic, Po Drange 30mm g # 5970-0130	E ACETAL ORG 30 ire Test Tube Rack 30mm tubes, orang ubes, Autoclavable ositions: 24, Descri er each	s: Resmer e, Array: 3 x 8, Autoclavable, Holds:	41.22	41.22
38	1	EA	Manufacturing For Use With: Tubes, Acetal	tific Nalgene Unw Technology, for 1 13mm Tubes, Au	72, Description: T	s: Resmer rray: 6 x 12, Red, /able, Holds: 13 mm	20.30	20.30



							ermo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-	1346-81	9 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Vendor Catalo This item is be	-	er each			
39	1	РК	Gauge: No Ne Yes, Length: N Included, Reco Luer-lock Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y	e Syringes with Luc edle Included, Cor lo Needle Included ommended Applica	d, Needle Point Nu ations: Healthcare	ne: 1 mL, Needle er Tip, Disposable:	62.12	62.1
40	1	PK	Type: Luer Tip Applications: H Vendor Catalog	e Syringes with Lue , Disposable: Yes, lealthcare, Sterile,	, Latex Free: Yes, , Termination: Lue	ne: 3 mL, Connection Recommended	22.90	22.9
41	1	PK	Volume: 5 mL, Yes, Recomme Luer-lock Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y	Syringes with Luc Connection Type ended Applications	: Luer Tip, Dispos s: Healthcare, Ste	_ok; Volume: 5mL, able: Yes, Latex Free:	20.09	20.0
42	1	CS	DWK Life Scie Red, For Use V Yes, Polypropy Vendor Catalog	nces Kimble Kim-l Nith: 13mm O.D. r /lene, Disposable:	plain-end culture to Yes	S losures, Closure Color: ubes, Autoclavable:	121.84	121.84
43	1	CS	x L: 13 x 100m Closure: KIM-k	sposable Borosilio m, Diameter Oute (AP, Non-sterile, <i>F</i>	er: 13mm, Length:	with Plain End, O.D. 100mm, Capacity: 10mL, Clear, Design Type:	36.26	36.20



					Part of Thermo Fisher Scientifi				
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page	
				2	2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	2-1346-81	10 of 30	
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descripti	ion		Unit Price	Extended Price	
			Vendor Catalog # This item is being		ch per case				
44	1	CS		CryoBoxes/Rack, 0.2 cm), Silver, Sta ertical, Quantity: 4/ 5036-0009	Racks, 14 x 14 Dimensions: 5 ainless Steel, C /cs.	.3 x 22.5cm, Design: 625 x 5.5 x 19.75	2,142.00	2,142.00	
45	1	РК	Ansell MICROFLE Applications: Indu	Istrial, AQL: 1.5, C FR 177.2600, EN e, Finger Thicknes sterile DF-850-S sold as 100 eac	F-850 Vinyl Glo Certifications/Co I 420:2003 + A1 ss: 3.5 mil, 0.09	ves, Size: Small, mpliance: ASTM :2009, Clear, Exterior	4.42	4.42	
46	1	PK	Thermo Scientific graduated, Descri	iption: 2.0mL Grad Capacity: 2mL, Pe t, 10 units/ case, 1 3434	etention Microc duated, Nonster olypropylene, P Non-sterile, Cap	entrifuge Tubes, 2mL, ile, Natural, Max. ackaging: 50 tubes/	126.00	126.00	
47	1	CS	Fisherbrand Disp Volume:10u; Colo	or: Yellow; Individu Paper Peel Pouch , Volume: 10uL, E : 22-363-600	y Loops and Neo ual wrapped, Ind n, Individually w Diameter Inside:	edles, Flexible Loop; oculating Loop and rapped, Packaging	50.23	50.23	

Nbr



Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

					Part of Ir	termo Fisher Scientific	
				Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	rence	Page
				2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	-1346-81	11 of 30
Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
1	CS	Inoculation Loo wrapped, Pack Inside: 0.035/0 Certificate of d Vendor Catalo	isposable Inocula op, Flexible, Natur aging Quantity: 2	-	edles, Combo uch, Individually /10uL, Diameter	55.67	55.67
1	CS	76.2mm), Leng in., Quantity: 2 Vendor Catalo	ile Gauze Sponge gth: 76.2mm, 3 in. 00 Bag, Non-ster	ile, Absorbancy: Si	x 3 in. (76.2 x y, Width: 76.2mm, 3	143.22	143.22
1	EA	80 x 155. Flash the flask and 3 maximize oxyg orbital shaker. plastic closure splashing that	250mL, 6 Baffles, 3 baffles on the bo gen transfer to the Delong style necl s, while the longe would reach the c g # CLS-2048-04	baffles on the lowe ttom surface of the culture medium w k is made to fit stai r neck reduces the	e flask to hen used on an nless steel or	50.17	50.17
NOBID)	*NO BID*					
1	EA	2-hydroxyprop alkolave, harto 1.00 AU max. a	99.9%, C3H8O, C ane, dimethylcarb sol, petrohol, isop at 205nm, 0.25 Al . at 254nm, 0.002 g # BPA451-1 .terial		3-0, 2-propanol, cohol, avantine,	40.92	40.92
1	EA	-	cid, CIH, CAS Nu	R ACID TRCE MT mber-7647-01-0, c acid, chlorwassers	chloorwaterstof,	78.92	78.92



							_
				Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	ence	Page
				2335-4767-7	5 RFQ REQTE 2152-	1346-81	12 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description		Unit Price	Extended Price
			spirits of salt, hyc	rial			
54	1	EA	Glycerol, >-99%, 1,2,3-trihydroxyp alcohol, glyceritol glycerine, 500mL		5, glycerin, panetriol, glycyl psmoglyn, g), CHEBI:17754, 1.26,	30.27	30.27
55	1	EA	Acetic Acid, 99.8 acetique, ethanoi acid, methanecar	[‡] 148930010 rial	19-7, ethylic acid, acide tasol, vinegar ıre, 1L, (neat), 0.1	80.68	80.68
56	1	EA	Tris(hydroxymeth trizma, trometam	¢ 167620010	111NO3, CAS Number-77-86 thane, tris buffer,	116.16 6-1,	116.10
57	1	EA	500-038-2, 270 d 60.0 deg.C, 15, 7	POLYETHYLENE GLYCOL 8 col), CAS Number-25322-68-3 leg.C, 12 to 16mg KOH/g, H(O '688, MFCD01779615, Averag 00, TSCA, 300-450 mPa.s (20	, PEG, 1kg, white flakes, CH2CH2)nOH, 55.0 deg.C to e M.W. 8000, Plastic	79.19	79.16



					Quote Nbr	Customer R	eference	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 21	52-1346-81	13 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descrip	tion		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 5Y This item is being		each			
58	2	EA	AC443572500 Thermo Scientific Format: Powder, Bottle, Grade: Ba Vendor Catalog # This item is being	Agar, Bacteriolo For Use With: M cteriological 443572500	icrobial media, P	ntity: 250g,	71.8	3 143.66
59	1	EA	BMA50001 S Lonza SeaKem Li Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 5Y This item is being Product - Non-Re	E Agarose, Qua 50001 sold as 1 per	AROSE 25G LO' ntity: 25g · each	WEEO	80.25	5 80.25
60	1	EA	BMA50843 Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3M This item is being		ER 1LT each		60.4	9 60.49
61	1	EA	Lonza AccuGENE	Buffer, 10X with torage Requiren 50844 ial	Concentration: 10 n 0.4M Tris aceta	te, 0.01M EDTA, DNA	85.3	9 85.39
62	1	EA		10, CAS Numbe FLBP120-500	, Disodium Salt D	Dihydrate, >-99.0%,	102.44	4 102.44
63	1	EA	Ethidium Bromide		lolecular Biology)	, Fisher BioReagents, 39-45-8, 7732-18-5,	62.8	1 62.81



				Quote Nbr	Customer Referen	ce	Page
				2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-13	46-81	14 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	•	Unit Price	Extended Price
			Red, Grade: Mole Molecular Weigh Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is being	# BP130210 rial	la: C21H20BrN3,		
64	1	EA	three elephant, h boron hydroxide,	# FLBP168-500	oron trihydroxide, x, 500g, Vapor	50.34	50.34
65	1	EA	sulfinylbis, dmso sulfoxide, demso	# BPBP231-100	nber-67-68-5, methane, , demavet, dimethyl e, methyl sulfoxide,	24.54	24.54
66	1	EA		rial	e Pancreas), Quantity:	539.60	539.60
67	1	EA	Monooleate, Poly 0.0001% max., G Test, 0.25% max Vendor Catalog #	TWEEN 80 500ML Number-9005-65-6, Polyoxyethyl ysorbate 80, 500mL, Vapor Pres Gray, Amber, 0.0005% max., 1.04 (., 15, 7703, HDPE Bottle, Liquid # BPBP338-500 g sold as 1 per each	sure: <1hPa at 20 deg.C, 80g/cm3, 65 to 80, Pass	35.50	35.50
68	1	EA	BP358 1	SODIUM CHLORIDE 1KG		45.86	45.86



				G	Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	ce	Page
				233	35-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-134	46-81	15 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descriptior	ı		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Sodium Chloride, >-99. rock salt, saline, purex, chloride, common salt, 440 deg.C, (Dry Basis) CHEBI:26710, Gray, W Vendor Catalog # FLBF This item is being sold a	sodium chlori salt, halite, 1kg >99.5%, >-99 hite 9358-1	de nacl, dend g, Vapor Pres .0 %, 1461 de	ritis, sodium sure: 1mmHg at		
69	NOBID		*NO BID* BP64	55				
70	1	EA		HEBI:3312, Gi 7-500	S Number-10 ray, Beige, 2.	043-52-4, 500g, 2% max.,	157.00	157.00
71	1	EA		trose, aldehyd anhydrous, glu htahydroxyhe , 500g, CHEB 6-500	H12O6, CAS do-d-glucose, ucosteril, d +-ç kanal, glucose I:42758	Number-50-99-7, dextrose dextrose, glucose,	21.07	21.07
72	1	EA	DF0713 17 9 MIDD BD Difco Dehydrated C Certifications/Complian With: Cultivation of Myc Packaging: Bottle, Quar Requirements: <30 deg Vendor Catalog # 2713 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold a	ce: AOAC, SN obacteria, Me ntity: 500g, Sh .C 10	Middlebrook 7 1WW, Format dia Type: Mid nelf Life: 1825	7H9 Broth, : Dehydrated, For Use dlebrook 7H9 Broth,	242.60	242.60
73	1	CS	FB0875712 PETRI Fisherbrand Petri Disher Raised Ridge, Diameter Color: Clear, Closure In 25/Sleeve, 20 Sleeves/v Vendor Catalog # 4317	r: 100mm, Hei cluded: Yes, E Cs., 500 Dishe	id, Raised rid ght: 15mm, P Edges: Raised	ge, Shape: Round, olystyrene, Closure	53.10	53.10



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-1	346-81	16 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Shelf Life 3Y This item is be	ing sold as 500	each per case			
74	1	EA	cycloheximide neocyclohexim 200-636-0, 28	kaken, naramyc iide, actidone, ac 1.35, YPHMISFO g # 0210018301 terial	AS Number-66-81 in a, hizarocin, cycl	CHEBI:27641, White,	93.89	93.89
75	1	EA	20mg, Concen Source: Boving Use With: Use	Is Deoxyribonucle tration: >-2,000K e pancreas, Stora d as a genetic ma g # 0210057520	U/mg, Format: Lyo	Pancreas, Quantity: ohilized Powder, 4 deg.C, White, For	317.28	317.28
76	1	EA		a minimum order POURITE TM AN g # 8-500	ANTI-BUBBLE ADI quantity of 3 per su ITI-BUBBLE ADDT	ipplier	74.33	74.33
77	NOBID		*NO BID*					
78	1	EA	Purifies linear 100mL Wizard	rd DNA Cleanup and circular DNA DNA cleanup res s, Storage Requir g # A7280	from 200 to 50,000	100 Preps, For Use With:)bp, Includes: nicolumns, 100 3cc	178.05	178.05
79	1	EA	QKNYBSVHE	MOAJP-UHFFFA	umber-1185-53-1,	500g, 157.56, Molecular, chloride, 157.594,	140.16	140.16



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	ence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-	1346-81	17 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Desc	ription		Unit Price	Extended Price
			93573, 15 to 30 Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 1Y This item is beir	# H5123	D)(CO)N)O.Cl ber each			
80	1	EA	Number-6131-9 acetate tn, natri	0-4, plasmafusi um acetate-3-w um salt, trihydra n, thomaegelin, # FLS209-500	0 to 101.0%, C2H9 in, sodium acetate t vasser, tutofusin, un ate, sodium acetate 500g	rihydrate, sodium i-4550k0sc9b,	49.3	4 49.34
81	1	EA	soda, caustic, so caustic soda, so	de, >-97.0%, H odium hydrate, dium hydroxide le, white caustio , 1390 deg.C # FLS318-100 erial	ascarite, soda lye, a e na oh, sodium hyd c, 100g, Vapor Pres	-1310-73-2, 497-19-8, aetznatron,	27.8	4 27.84
82	1	EA	Use With: Provid	des up to 5 hou n, Recommende # 65 erial	-	-	52.73	3 52.73
83	1	EA		_PG Burner But ner, LPG, Recc # 65F erial	NT FUEL FOR S41 tane Fuel, For Use to ommended Application	With: Replacement	15.98	3 15.98
84	NOBID		*NO BID*					
85	NOBID		*NO BID*					



					Quote Nbr	Customer Referen	ce	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-13	46-81	18 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Desci	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
86	NOBID		*NO BID*					
87	NOBID		*NO BID*					
88	1	РК	Diameter: 125n linters, Ashless Filtration Speed 100Pack, Thick Vendor Catalog	n Grade 589/3 C nm, Format: Circ Quantitative Filt d: 375 sec., Parti ness: 160um	S 125MM 100/PK Quantitative Filter P ele, Grade: 589/3, H er Paper, Basis We cle Retention: Very each per pack	igh-quality cotton sight: 84g/m2,	66.46	66.46
89	1	EA	Length: 125 ft., cost-effective c	M Laboratory W 38 m, Sealing F overing, over wr shelf or tray liner hermoplastic g # PM996	N X 125 FT/RL /rapping Film, Widt ilm, Applications: E ap to further secure to prevent slipping per each	fficient and stoppers, lids,	71.70	71.70
90	1	EA	algrain, ethyl al alcohol, tecsol, (v/v), 2ppm ma	%, C2H6O, CAS cohol, alcohol, n alcohol, anhydro x., 78 deg.C, CH g # BP2818-500 erial	BIOLOGY GRADE S Number-64-17-5, nethylcarbinol, ethy bl, 500mL, Pass Te IEBI:16236, Red, C per each	ethyl hydroxide, l hydrate, grain st, Assay: >-99.5%	36.34	36.34
91	1	EA	7791-18-6, mag anhydrous, ma dichloride, mag max., >-99.0 %	loride Hexahydr gnesium chloride gnesiumchlorid, nesium chloride , 0.01% max. g # FLBP214-500	anhydrous, magno magnesium ii chlor , mgcl2, chloromag	g, CAS Number-7786-30-3,	64.95	64.95
92	1	EA	BP1423 500	AGAR GRAN	ULATED 500G		152.46	152.46



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	2-1346-81	19 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Quantity: 500g,	Format: Powder for culture med # BP1423500	ioReagents, Packa to Flakes, For Use ia, Grade: Molecul er each	With: Used for a		
93	1	EA	Poly Bottle, Qua	ntity: 500g, Fori available to bac ics # BP1420500		÷	65.47	65.47
94	1	EA	120V, AmperageExterior: 7.97 in.	log Vortex Mixe e: 1.2 amps, He , 20.2cm, Shipp , 12.1cm, Dime 2.7cm) # 80863016	R ANALOG 120V er, Speed: 300 to 3 ight Exterior: 5 in., bing Weight: 10 lb., nsions Exterior: 7.9 er each	12.7cm, Length 4.5kg, Width	309.58	309.58
95	1	EA	1.5/2 mL, 10 x 5 Product Line: Fr	ifuge 5425, Cor mL, Max. RCF: ontier 5000 Seri ns/Compliance: irect # 5405000247	-	ad, Capacity: 24 x Speed: 15,060 rpm, ed: No, Amperage:	2,497.38	2,497.38
96	1	EA	3%, Volume: 2 to Autoclavable, Co	e Adjustable-Vo o 20 uL, Incremo ompatible Tips: ides: Calibratior # 4680030	D ELITE 2-20UL lume Pipettors, 2-2 ents: 0.02uL, Autoo SureOneTM tips, F n certificate, in-lab er each	inger Style:	161.08	161.08



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-1	346-81	20 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
97	1	EA	0.6 to 1.8% Autoclavabl Ergonomic, Vendor Cata	Elite Adjustable-Vo , Volume: 20 to 200 e, Compatible Tips: Includes: Calibration alog # 4680060	uL, Increments: 0.2 SureOneTM tips, F	200uL, Accuracy: 2uL, Autoclavable: Finger Style:	174.48	174.48
98	1	EA	For Use Wit Vendor Cata	Scienceware Pipette th: Pipets, Resistanc alog # F37898-0000	e: Acid and Alkali	reen, Volume: 10 mL,	31.47	31.47
99	1	CS	Mouth: Narr Borosilicate Material: Pc 56mm, Gra Vendor Cata	BTL MEDIA P usable Media Storag row, Quantity: 10/Cs Glass, Non-sterile, olypropylene, Closur iduations: 40 to 80 n alog # 1395-100 being sold as 10 e	., Closure Size: GL Closure Color: Ora e Type: Screw Cap nL	: 3.3 oz., 100 mL, 45, Orange, nge, Closure	57.84	57.84
100	1	CS	Capacity: 3. to 80mL, He Non-sterile, Closure Typ Vendor Cate	I Reusable Glass Ma 3 oz., 100 mL, Diam eight: 3.9 in., 100mm Closure Color: Blue	neter: 2.2 in., 56mm n, Closure Size: GL e, Closure Material:	ap, Capacity: 100mL, n, Graduations: 20 45, Natural,	57.36	57.36
101	1	CS	oz., 250 mL Orange, Bo Closure Ma 2.7 in., 70 n Vendor Cata	usable Media Storag ., Mouth: Wide, Qua rosilicate Glass, Nor terial: Polypropylene	ntity: 10/Cs., Closu n-sterile, Closure C e, Closure Type: Sc	8 oz.), Capacity: 8.45 re Size: GL45, olor: Orange,	65.09	65.09



					Quest NI			Den
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	rence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	-1346-81	21 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
102	1	CS	Capacity: 8.45 to 200mL, Hei Non-sterile, C Closure Type: Vendor Catalo	eusable Glass Me 5 oz., 250 mL, Diar ight: 5.4 in., 138mr losure Color: Blue,	neter: 2.7 in., 70m n, Closure Size: G , Closure Material:	ap, Capacity: 250mL, m, Graduations: 50 L45, Natural,	63.66	63.66
103	1	CS	Mouth: Wide, Borosilicate G Material: Poly 86 mm, Gradu Vendor Catalo	able Media Storag Quantity: 10/Cs., (lass, Non-sterile, (propylene, Closure uations: 100 to 400) mL	5; 17 oz., 500 mL, 5, Orange,	78.75	78.75
104	1	CS	Capacity: 17 c to 400mL, Hei Non-sterile, C Closure Type: Vendor Catalo	eusable Glass Me oz., 500 mL, Diame ght: 6.9 in., 176mr losure Color: Blue,	eter: 3.3 in., 86mm n, Closure Size: G , Closure Material:	ap, Capacity: 500mL, , Graduations: 100 L45, Natural,	71.82	71.82
105	1	CS	mL, 1 L, Mout Borosilicate G Material: Poly 101 mm Vendor Catalo	h: Narrow, Quantit lass, Non-sterile, (propylene, Closure	e Bottles, 1L, Capa y: 10/Cs., Closure Closure Color: Ora e Type: Plug Seal,	0	95.84	95.84
106	1	CS	Capacity: 33.8 100 to 900mL	eusable Glass Me 3 oz., 1000 mL, Dia , Height: 8.8 in., 22 losure Color: Blue,		ap, Capacity: 1000mL, Imm, Graduations: e: GL45, Natural,	94.50	94.50



						Part of	Thermo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Re	ference	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 215	52-1346-81	22 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			-) # FS14395-100 ng sold as 10 e				
107	1	CS	Capacity: 50 ml	ices Kimble KIM/ L, 100 mL, 250 m y: +/-5%, Certific # 14080-01			37.78	37.78
108	1	EA	in., 8mm, Lengt Dimensions: 2 x Octagonal, Cerr Quantity: 50, St Vendor Catalog	tagon Spinbar M h: 2 in., 50.8mm < 0.31 in. (50.8 x tifications/Compli ir bar, Width: 0.3	1 in., 8mm	rs, Diameter: 0.31 s, White,	6.99	6.99
109	1	EA	Capacity: 1200 Certifications/C	g, Readability: 0 ompliance: ISO/0 CD, Electrical Re I # 30029122	Precision Balances .01 g, Stabilization	ype: RS-232, Display	1,039.50	1,039.50
110	1	PK	Adapter for Ova Platelet-rich Pla 6/8 x 250mL, Fo Vendor Catalog	fic 250mL Platele al Single Blood B asma or Buffy Co or Use With: Ova	FFY COAT BAG P et-rich Plasma or B ag Buckets, Descr at Bag Adapter (se Il single blood bag ach per pack	uffy Coat Bag ption: 250mL t of 2), Capacity:	218.79	218.79
111	1	EA	Shakers Packag deg.F, 7 to 60 c	ntific Excella E24 ge, Model: Excel leg.C, Length Pla D/100V, Width Pl rm			7,866.00	7,866.00



Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

							ermo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-	1346-81	23 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			This item is being	sold as 1 p	er each			
112	1	EA	Fisherbrand Isote Block, Electrical F Steel, Relative Hu	mp Digital Dry Requirements: Imidity: <80%, tifications/Cor 88860021	100/120 V, 50/60 F Temperature Rang	ers, No. of Places: 1	312.37	312.3
113	1	EA	Corning LSE Digit Ambient +5 deg. t Chamber: 6.7 in.,	al Water Bath o 99 deg.C, C 17 cm Chamb : 29 x 38 x 23 /er) 6783	ontroller Type: PID per, Depth: 29 cm, [Temperature Range: , Depth Interior:	841.51	841.5
114	1	EA	13 998 035 H	HERA150I CO	2 SST IR 120V		11,760.00	11,760.0
			Thermo Scientific Description: Singl Electrical Require	Heracell 150i e 150L incuba ments: 120 V, erial: Electropo t 37 deg.C 51026406 sold as 1 p turnable	CO2 Incubator, IR ttor, CO2 Sensor Te 50/60 Hz, Capacity blished Stainless Sta er each	echnology: IR sensor, /: 150 L, 5.3 cu.	_	
			Extended warrar	nty available fo	or purchase below: ARRANTY INCUBA		=	
115	1	EA	UVP MultiDoc-It I	maging Syster M-20, Voltage ng, Waveleng	: 115V, For Use Wi	20 ging System (3 door), th: Fluorescent and	6,510.20	6,510.20

This item is being sold as 1 per each



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	rence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152	-1346-81	24 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
116	1	EA	Cord Vendor Catalor This item is be ====================================	g # 840-281700 ing sold as 1 p rranty available fo SPECTRONIC UNITY BASIC I	200; Thermo Scier er each or purchase below: 200 EXTENDED W DEPOT WAR SPE			2,257.18
117	1	EA	Amperage: 400 Use With: SDS	ectrophoresis Po 0 mA, Voltage: 30 3-PAGE, DGGE/C ons: 10.25 x 5.5 x g # FB300Q			522.16	522.16
118	1	EA	Description: Ge 38 x 11cm, Ce	ific Owl A6 Wide el size: 23 x 25cm rtifications/Compl . (35 x 38 x 11 cm m g # A6	n; Buffer volume: 3	ctrophoresis System, .; L x W x H: 35 x Dimensions: 13.75 x	959.80	959.80
119	NOBIE)	*NO BID*					
120	1	EA	Capacity: 5 cu. Amperage: 1.1 Rear, Certificat Mounted, Defre Vendor Catalon Hazardous Ma This item is be	ific Value Lab Un ft., 141.6 L, Elec A, Casters: 2 Ad tions/Compliance ost: Manual g # 05LFEETSA terial ing sold as 1 p	er each	s: 115 V 60 Hz, ont, 2 Fixed Pads In	1,605.60	1,605.60



						Part of	Thermo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Ref	erence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 215	2-1346-81	25 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			70 105 6239 UN	ITY BASIC D		•		
121	1	EA	NC1031425 UR Uranyl Acetate pre-r work easier. Other p Vendor Catalog # 22 Hazardous Material	made and reapercentages a	-	n for making your	80.40	80.40
122	NOBID		*NO BID* 11	52049S				
123	1	EA	Thermo Scientific Al Grade, protease and	bumin, Bovir d enzyme-fre , Formulation RUO, EINEC 55731-22	e, pH 7.0, Quantit : Lyophilized pow S Number: 232-93	V, 98%, Immunoassay y: 100g, Format: der, Recombinant: No,	213.74	213.74
124	1	EA	Blocks for Fisherbra of Places: 18, Alumi	nd Isotemp I num Alloy, F creen Dry Ba d 2.0 mL, Ac 3860113	or Use With: Ther hths/Block Heaters cessory, Block	lock Heaters, No.	82.95	82.9
125	1	EA	05 400 008 24- Eppendorf Model 54 Includes: Aerosol-tig 5430 Microcentrifug Angle: Fixed, No. of Vendor Catalog # 02 This item is being so	24 Microcen ght lid, Capac e, Max. RCF Places: 24, I 22653008	city: 24 x 1.5/2mL, : 21,130 x g, Max.	For Use With:	949.42	949.42
126	1	EA	BP1422 500 YE Fisher BioReagents Quantity: 500g, Forr Packaging: Poly Bot Molecular genetics Vendor Catalog # B	Microbiology mat: Dehydra ttle, Descripti	ited, Media Type:	Yeast Extract, Yeast Extract,	116.87	116.87



						IO FISHER Scientific	
				Quote Nbr	Customer Referen	се	Page
				2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-13	46-81	26 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number D	escription		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as	1 per each			
127	1	PK	02 202 101 WEIGH BO Fisherbrand Hexagonal Pol Diameter Inner Base: 47 m For Use With: Design provi Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 0220210 This item is being sold as	m, Diameter Inner Top: des greater balance, pr 1	nes, Depth: 15 mm, 67 mm, Weight: 1.4 g,	69.87	69.87
128	1	PK	02 202 103 WEIGH BO Fisherbrand Hexagonal Pol Diameter Inner Base: 92 m g, For Use With: Design pro safety, Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 0220210 This item is being sold as	m, Diameter Inner Top: ovides greater balance, 3	132 mm, Weight: 7.1	267.70	267.70
129	1	EA	Eisco Bunsen Burners, Bas cm Vendor Catalog # CH09911			41.68	41.68
130	1	CS	DWK Life Sciences Kimble mL, Borosilicate Glass, Aut Baffled, Diameter Outer: 1.3 Vendor Catalog # 25630-25	oclavable: Autoclavable 5 in., 38 mm		143.00	143.00
131	1	CS	10 140 6C FLASK BA DWK Life Sciences Kimble DWK Life Sciences Kimble mL, Borosilicate Glass, Aut Baffled, Diameter Outer: 1.3 Vendor Catalog # 25630-10 This item is being sold as	oclavable: Autoclavable 5 in., 3.8 cm		255.48	255.48



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-	1346-81	27 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
132	1	CS	14 957 85JCLPYREX PolypropylerClosure Color: NaturePolypropylere, CloseDisposable: No, FormLess necks, No. pVendor Catalog # 20This item is being set	ene Flask Clo ral, Autoclav sure Type: C Use With: C er Case: 100 6797-38	vable: Autoclavable losure, Diameter O Culture tubes and fl 0/Cs.	uter Neck: 3.8 cm, , Closure Material: uter: 38 mm,	210.80	210.80
133	1	EA	Thermo Scientific N Includes: PR-1 pede verification solution, Power Cable, Warra Vendor Catalog # 8 This item is being se ====================================	anoDrop On estal conditio USB memo anty: 2 year 40-274100 old as 1 p old as 1 p v available fo R EXT WAR R EXT WAR	oning solution, PV- ory device, Microfibe er each or purchase below: R NDONE NDONEC R NDONE NDONEC	Vis Spectrophotometer, performance er screen wipe, USA		12,150.00
134	1	EA		Anhydrous, It 1:1, mgso4 hate, bitter s ium sulfate a), Gray, Whit LM65-500	4, sal de sedlitz, sal alt, magnesium sul anhydrous, 500g, 0	ber-7487-88-9, sulfuric angalis, tomix fate, magnesium	71.91	71.91
135	1	EA	FEREO0491 PF Thermo Scientific P 1mL, Concentration Vendor Catalog # E Hazardous Material Shelf Life 4Y This item is being se	roteinase K, : >600 U/mL O0491			59.94	59.94



Price

147.80

Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 2152-1346-81 2335-4767-75 28 of 30 Unit Extended Nbr Qty UN Description **Catalog Number** Price CS **50ML BIORXN STANDING TUBE** 147.80 136 1 50 202 015 CELLTREAT Scientific Products 50mL Bio-reaction Tube Self Standing. Bio-reaction tubes offer a convenient and economical option for small scale, high density suspension cell culture. Ideal for biological reaction applications and free gas exchange. Aseptic conditions maintained through 0.22?m hydrophobic vented membrane. Useful in the screening and optimization processes of suspension cells. Reaction parameters can be optimized using small amounts of materials, maximizing the number of parallel experiments that can be performed simultaneously. Ideal for suspension cell culture, bacterial growth,

> seeding larger bioreactors, supporting start-up testing procedures for larger bioreactors, and lyophilization. Easy to read black

the lot number for quality traceability. Packaged sterile,

This item is being sold as 100 each per case

10/re-sealable bag, 100/case. Vendor Catalog # 229479

graduations and a large white marking area. RNase/DNase free and non-pyrogenic. Max force (RCF) g 16000. Every case is printed with

137 1 EA	White, Pass OOYGSFOG Vendor Catal	KANAMYCIN MONO SULFATE 5G ulfate, C18H38N4O15S, CAS Number-25389-94-0, 5g, Gray, Fest, >250 deg.C, 582.58, < 1.0%, FJDDHP-IZQIRFRQSA-N og # FLBP906-5 eing sold as 1 per each	62.81	62.81
138 NOBID	*NO BID*	NC9816288		
139 1 EA	500g, Format casein is use Tryptone, Pa Grade: Molec	TRYPTONE 500G agents Microbiology Media Additives: Tryptone, Quantity: : Dehydrated Powder, For Use With: Pancreatic digest of d as a nitrogen source for bacteria, Media Type: ckaging: Poly Bottle, Description: Bacterial Culture, cular genetics og # BP1421500 eing sold as 1 per each	136.40	136.40

140 NOBID

--NO BID--



					•			_
					Quote Nbr	Customer Referen	ce	Page
					2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-13	46-81	29 of 30
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Desc	ription		Unit Price	Extended Price
141	1	EA	to the gel slice transfer to the for organic de Fast-Spin colu minutes. DNA is perfectly su	e specially formul containing your supplied Zymo-S naturants or chlor umn technology to purified using the ited for use in DN reactions, PCR, e	A ligation reactions	lving Buffer (ADB) solve, and then There is no need product utilizes DNA in just 15 Gel DNA Recovery Kit	88.84	88.8
142	1	EA	2225532, CHI Statement WIIZWVCIJK0 2,2-dichloro-N	col, >-99%, C11H EBI:17698, 200-24 >H350-H361, P2(GZOK-RKDXNWH -[(1R,2R)-1,3-dih og # B20841-14	87-4, 323.14, H350 01-P202-P281-P308 HRSA-N,	Number-56-75-7, 25g, 0.99, GHS H	47.57	47.5
143	1	PK	gap size, 50 ir		-	/M 50P ation cuvettes, 1 mm	93.00	93.0
144	1	EA	alkaline lysis s resuspension procedures. S directly to you Zymo-Spin co buffers include cell lysis and r fastest and ea Coli efficiently and well suite restriction end	asmid Miniprep Ki system that bypas steps common to imply add the uni r bacterial culture lumn technology. ed in the kit allow neutralization. The siest method ava . The plasmid DN d for use in transf lonuclease digest nd other sensitive og # D4020	MID MINIPREP 400 it features a pellet-fr sees the normal cell o classical plasmid p quely formulated 7> a, neutralize, and the Additionally, the pa for easy visualization e Zyppy Plasmid Mi ilable to separate p IA is high quality, er ection, bacterial tran ion, DNA ligation, P e downstream applie	ee modified pelleting and reparation (Lysis Buffer en purify with tented colored on of complete hiprep Kit is the asmid DNA from E. dotoxin-free, hsformation, CR, transcription,	369.27	369.2



Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	Page
2335-4767-75	RFQ REQTE 2152-1346-81	30 of 30

Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price
			This item is being	sold as 1 per each		
145	1	EA	It can also be used sequencing-ready formulated DNA B to the supplied Zy denaturants or chl column technology in just 2 minutes. sequencing, labeli	NA CLEAN AND CONC-25 200 PREP d for post-RT cDNA clean-up and purification of DNA from M13 phage. Simply add the specially inding Buffer to your sample and transfer the mixtu mo-Spin™ Column. There is no need for orgat oroform. Instead, the product features ZymoSpin y to yield DNA that is free of salts and contaminants The purified DNA is ideal for DNA ligation, ng, PCR, microarray, transfection, transformation, estion procedures. D4006	nic	269.3
146 1	1		Product Image not- valiable from Suppler atitrantin stronger forms an insoluble are water-soluble)		51.60	51.6
IOTE			Container	NDISE TOTAL /Ice Charges s Material Charge		63,213.11 33.00 34.00 63,280.11

ect to manufacturer terms and conditions. Returns are subj

We now offer highly competitive financing with low monthly payments. Please contact your local sales representative for more information.

Tell us about your recent customer service experience by completing a short survey. This should take no longer than three minutes. Enter the link into your browser and enter the passcode: USA-PGH-CS2 http://survey.medallia.com/fishersci