*Quote Nbr	Creation Date	Due Date	Page		
2053-9297-76	02/22/2022	1 of 34			
Payment	Terms	Deliver	y Terms		
NET 30	DAYS	DE	ST		
Valio	d To	Prepar	ed By		
06/22/	2022	SHERD	EL, RON		
Customer	Reference	Sales Rep	presentative		
RFQ REQTE 10	28-1376-25 RD	RONALD SHERDEL			
To place an order	Ph: 800-766-7000	Fx: 800-926-1166			
Submit	ted To:	Customer Account	: 374633-070		
TIFFANY MORAND MORANDT@HHMI.OR 301-215-8589	G	HHMI UMBC DEPT 1000 HILLTOP CIF BALTIMORE MD 2 ATTN: TIFFANY M	RCLE 1250		



FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LLC 4500 TURNBERRY DRIVE HANOVER PARK IL 60133-5491

Review and Place Order

Click here or go through your purchasing system to fishersci.com quotes

*Please reference this Quote Number on all correspondence.

Don't have a profile? Register on fishersci.com

For complete Terms and Conditions, please click here.

Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1	EA	46cm, 18 in., samples	ALUMINUM FOIL 18IN X 50FT Aluminum Foil, Length: 50 ft., Thickness: 0.024mm, Width: Applications: For sealing, weighing, and transferring og # 75SQ.FT eing sold as 1 per each 42.20 CDC: 017	16.68	16.68
2	1	PK	Width: 9cm, 3 Thickness: 2 Vendor Catal Shelf Life 3Y	og # SCSF eing sold as 200 each per pack 85.10 CDC: 182	31.29	31.29
3	1	CS	Caps, Capac Quantity: 12, Yes, Closure Vendor Catal	JAR CLR ST SD W/PTFE 16OZ 12CS Clear Straight Sided Glass Jars with White Polypropylene ity: 480 mL, 16 oz., Closure Liner: PE Foam/PTFE, Glass (Type 3), Closure Color: White, Closure Included: Material: Polypropylene, Neck Finish: 89-400 og # W014216 eing sold as 12 each per case 214.50 CDC: 021	48.07	48.07



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 2 of 34 Unit Extended Qty UN Nbr **Catalog Number** Description Price Price 04 355 16 **BACDOWN HANDSOAP 1 LITER** 23.44 1 EA 23.44 4 Decon Bacdown Hand Soap, Size: 34 oz., 1L, Packaging: Bottle, one pump, Boiling Point: >212 deg.F, Format: Liquid, For Use With: For laboratory personnel, Fragrance: Almond, pH Range: 7.2, Quantity: Each, Recommended Applications: Safety Vendor Catalog # 7001 This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 46.65 CDC: 098 NOBID *--NO BID--* 5 6 PK 05 402 TUBES 1.5ML NATURAL 500/PK 35.47 35.47 1 Eppendorf Snap-Cap Microcentrifuge Flex-Tube Tubes, Natural, Max. Force: 30000xG, Packaging: 500/Pk., Autoclavable: Yes, Capacity: 1.5mL, Diameter Outer: 10mm, Graduated: Yes, Length: 38mm, Polypropylene, Non-sterile, Cap Style: Snap Cap, Closure Type: Snap Vendor Catalog # 022364111 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack 54.20 CDC: 014 List Price: CS 06 443 18 FB50MLTBE PP\FLAT\GRD\S 500CS 136.97 136.97 1 7 Fisherbrand Higher-Speed 50mL Easy Reader Plastic Centrifuge Tubes, Closure Type: Flat Cap, Packaging: Rack, Capacity: 1.69 oz., 50mL, Graduations: Yes, Includes: Black graduations, PP (Polypropylene), Sterile, Diameter Outside: 1.1 in., 28mm, Label Type: White Marking Spot, Length: 115mm Vendor Catalog # 431263 Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as 500 each per case List Price: 369.00 CDC: 019 CENTRIFUGE TUBE PC 50ML 10/PK ΡK 05 529C 53.75 53.75 8 1 Thermo Scientific Nalgene Oak Ridge High-Speed Polycarbonate Centrifuge Tubes, 50mL, With screw caps; Capacity: 50mL, Diameter Outside: 28.8mm, Autoclavable: Yes, Graduations: None, PC (Polycarbonate), No. per Pack: 10, Non-sterile, Writing Area: No, Bottom Shape: Round, Closure: Included Vendor Catalog # 3118-0050 This item is being sold as 10 each per pack List Price: 253.00 CDC: 018



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-7	1376-25 RD	3 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
9	1	CS	Fisherbrand Easy Capacity: 15mL, Sterile, Clear, Gra (Polypropylene), Label Type: Whit Vendor Catalog # This item is being	 Reader Conica 0.50 oz., Closuraduations: 0.5m No. per Pack: 5 Marking Spot 430885 	nL, Includes: Black 50, Diameter Outsid each per case	entrifuge Tubes, Packaging: Racked, graduations, PP	117.22	117.22
10	1	PK			RCK .2PCR TUBS		35.65	35.65
			3.8cm), Assorted Autoclavable, Yes mm, Includes: Re Vendor Catalog # This item is being	(Blue, Green, C s, Polypropylen emovable, hinge fHS23461AF	Orange, Pink, Yello e, PCR Rack, Dep ed lid	.5 in. H (12.7 x 10.1 x ow), Autoclavable: th: 130 mm, Height: 33		
11	1	CS			FUNL .22POR 12		147.70	147.70
			Membrane Mater 54.5cm2, Volume Disposable: Yes Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being	ial: Cellulose A Receiver: 100 431205	cetate, Volume: 50 0mL, Connectors: ach per case	is, Pore Size: 0.2um, 10mL, Filtration Area: Angled hose,		
12	1	CS			OP 50ML 22UM 12		54.46	54.46
			0.22 um, Volume 50 mL polypropyl stands, orange H Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being	150 mL, Inclue ene receiver ce DPE plug seal, 430320	des: 150 mL polys entrifuge tube, two Polystyrene, Cellu ach per case	-		



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	4 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
13	1	РК	Filter Materia MBS/Polypro Connectors: cm, Diamete Vendor Catal Shelf Life 2Y	na Steriflip Sterile D II: Polyethersulfone opylene, Polyethers Double lead thread r Membrane: 6.4 cn log # SCGP00525	(PES), Pore Size: ulfone, Volume: 50 with vacuum port, n, Disposable: Yes each per pack	Filter Units, 0.22 um, mL, Clear, Diameter Filter: 4	119.86	119.86
14	1	РК	Diameter: 11 Porosity: 6un Description: 0 110 mm Vendor Cata		cles, Grade: Grade ow Rate: 26sec./10 Filter Paper Stand each per pack	nd Sheets - Grade 3, 3, Cellulose, 00mL/sq. in.,	27.46	27.46
15	1	РК	Dimensions: Graduations: on each strip Quantity: 100 Vendor Cata	nan pH Indicator Pa 80 x 6mm, Color B 0.5 pH units, Inclu , complementary in	onded, pH Test Sti des: Plastic suppol dicator charts, Len each per pack	H Range: 4.5 to 10, ip, Format: Strip, ts, paper segments	24.33	24.33
16	1	РК	Pore Size: 0. 25 mm Steril Disposable: V Vendor Cata	man GD/X Sterile P	Yes, Volume: >10 S filtration medium : 4.6 cm2 each per pack	Diameter: 25 mm, mL, Description: GD/X	193.94	193.94



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	5 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
17	1	CS	250 mL, Boro Description: 1 Use With: Ide Style: Narrow Vendor Catal	ow Mouth Erlenmey silicate Glass, Bott op style: Tooled, E al for shaker cultur	om Shape: Baffleo Diameter Outer: 3.3 es, Height: 6.1 in., ach per case	vith Baffles, Capacity: I, Closure Size: 6, B in., 85 mm, For	215.04	215.04
18	1	CS	10 530	FLSK PETG BA	AF 250 VENT 12/0	S	145.58	145.58
			Baffled Botton Closure Size: per Pack: 1, S Vendor Catal Shelf Life 5Y	n: Sterile, 250mL, 38-430 mm, Closu Shape: Erlenmeyer og # 4116-0250 eing sold as 12 e 227.50 CDC: 016	vented, Capacity: : ire Type: Vent, No , Surface Coating: each per case	per Case: 12, No.		
19	1	CS	10 531		AF 500 VENT 12/0		185.92	185.92
			Baffled Bottor Closure Size: per Pack: 1, S Vendor Catal Shelf Life 5Y	n: Sterile, 500mL, 45-430 mm, Closu Shape: Erlenmeyer og # 4116-0500 eing sold as 12 e 287.00 CDC: 016	vented, Capacity: : ire Type: Vent, No , Surface Coating: each per case	. per Case: 12, No.		
20	1	CS	10 532		AF 1000 VENT 6/0	-	129.57	129.57
			Baffled Bottor Closure Size: Pack: 1, Shap Vendor Catal Shelf Life 5Y	n: Sterile, 1000mL 45-430 mm, Closu be: Erlenmeyer, Su og # 4116-1000 eing sold as 6 ea 195.00 CDC: 016	, vented, Capacity ire Type: Vent, No rface Coating: Nor ach per case	. per Case: 6, No. per		



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 6 of 34 Extended Unit UN Nbr Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price FLSK PETG BAF 2000 VENT 4/CS CS 21 2 10 533 98.68 197.36 Thermo Scientific Nalgene Single-Use PETG Erlenmeyer Flasks with Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 2000mL, vented, Capacity: 2000 mL, 64 oz., Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Closure Type: Vent, No. per Case: 4, No. per Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmeyer, Surface Coating: None Vendor Catalog # 4116-2000 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 4 each per case 149.50 CDC: 016 List Price: Medical Device GLASS BEADS SOLID 3MM 1LB/PK PK 11 312A 22 1 16.20 16.20 Walter Stern Economical Solid Glass Beads for Distillation Columns, Diameter: 3 mm Vendor Catalog # 100C This item is being sold as 1 per pack List Price: 43.75 CDC: 019 12 007 HOODED GAS LIGHTER 23 1 CS 55.04 55.04 Fisherbrand Shurlite Safety Gas Lighters, For Use With: Capable of lighting any flammable gas Vendor Catalog # 3001 This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 133.40 CDC: 021 13 675 2C 24 2 CS PIPET STER 2ML(0.01GRAD)500/CS 76.80 153.60 Fisherbrand Sterile Polystyrene Disposable Serological Pipets with Magnifier Stripe, Volume: 2 mL, 0.06 oz., Bulk, Tolerance: +/-0.04 mL, Green, Graduations: 0.01 mL, Calibration: To Deliver/Blow Out Vendor Catalog # 4321 This item is being sold as 500 each per case List Price: 202.00 CDC: 030 25 2 CS 13 678 11 PIPET STER 25ML(0.08GRAD)200CS 59.12 118.24 Fisherbrand Sterile Polystyrene Disposable Serological Pipets with Magnifier Stripe, Volume: 25 mL, Individually Wrapped, paper-plastic wrap, Tolerance: +/-0.5 mL, Red, Graduations: 0.2 mL Vendor Catalog # 431032 This item is being sold as 200 each per case List Price: 243.00 CDC: 019



o Fisher Scientific Part of

						Part of Ther	mo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-137	76-25 RD	7 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
26	1	CS	Magnifier Strip wrap, Tolerand To Deliver/Blo Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 3Y	terile Polystyrene e, Volume: 5 mL, ce: +/-0.1 mL, Blue w Out	-	gical Pipets with ed, paper-plastic	22.81	22.81
27	1	CS	Magnifier Strip wrap, Tolerand To Deliver/Blo Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 3Y		23.89			
28	1	CS	Volume: 2.5ml Multipette, For Style: Positive Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y	mbitips Advanced _, Color Code: Gre	each per case	ndard, Sterile, Eppendorf	164.12	164.12

29	1	EA	13 807 10	TEST TUBE BASKET 4X4X6IN	33.01	33.01
				Aluminum Baskets with Tilt-Top Lids, Dimensions: 4 x 4 x x 15.2cm), Autoclavable: Not Autoclavable, Closure		
				s, Height: 6 in., 15.2 cm, Length: 4 in., 10 cm, Width: 4		
			in., 10 cm			
			Vendor Catal	og # 1380710		
				eing sold as 1 per each 51.70 CDC: 007		



						Part of The	rmo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	8 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
30	1	EA	6 in. (10 x 10 x Included: Yes, in., 10 cm Vendor Catalo	luminum Baskets < 15.2cm), Autocla Height: 6 in., 15.2	avable: Not Autocla 2 cm, Length: 4 in. er each		33.01	33.01
31	1	EA	(25 x 15 x 15.) No, Height: 6 Vendor Catalo	luminum Baskets 2cm), Autoclavable n., 15.2 cm, Lengt	e: Not Autoclavable th: 10 in., 25 cm, V er each	ensions: 10 x 6 x 6 in. e, Closure Included: Vidth: 6 in., 15 cm	35.56	35.56
32	1	РК	510mm), Qua 610mm, Width keep spills fro Vendor Catalo	bsorbent Underpa ntity: 50 Pack, Abs n: 20 in., 510mm, F m spreading, Poly	ethylene each per pack	4 x 20 in. (610 x	27.83	27.83
33	1	РК	Not Autoclava Dimensions: 4 in., 7.3 cm, Le in., 7.8 cm Vendor Catalo	enceware Microce ble, Holds: 1.5mL .68 x 3.06 x 2.93 i	Tubes, Positions: in. (11.9 x 7.8 x 7.3 9 cm, Quantity: 4/F ach per pack	Rack, Autoclavable: 24, Microtube Rack, 3cm), Height: 2.93	39.00	39.00
34	1	EA	Manufacturing White, For Use	tific Nalgene Unwi Technology, for 2 e With: 20mm Tub Acetal Plastic, Po	E TEST TUBE WH ire Test Tube Rack 20mm tubes, white bes, Autoclavable: positions: 40, Descri	ks: Resmer , Array: 4 x 10, Autoclavable, Holds:	32.68	32.68



						Part of The	rmo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	9 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Vendor Catalog This item is bein List Price: 6					
35	1	EA	Manufacturing T For Use With: 30 Tubes, Acetal Pl Unwire Wht 30m Vendor Catalog This item is bein	c Nalgene Unwi echnology, for 3 Omm Tubes, Aut astic, Positions: Im, Diameter Op # 5970-0030	oclavable: Autocla 24, Description: T bening: 30 mm er each	s: Resmer , Array: 3 x 8, White, vable, Holds: 30mm	38.71	38.7
36	1	EA	Manufacturing T Orange, For Use 20 mm Tubes, A Rack Unwire Ora Vendor Catalog This item is bein	c Nalgene Unwi echnology, for 2 With: 20mm Tu cetal Plastic, Po ange 20mm # 5970-0120	ositions: 40, Descr er each	s: Resmer le, Array: 4 x 10, e: Autoclavable, Holds:	32.02	32.0
37	1	EA	Manufacturing T Orange, For Use 30 mm Tubes, A Rack Unwire Ora Vendor Catalog This item is bein	c Nalgene Unwi echnology, for 3 With: 30mm Tu cetal Plastic, Po ange 30mm # 5970-0130	ositions: 24, Descr er each	s: Resmer le, Array: 3 x 8, : Autoclavable, Holds:	41.22	41.2
38	1	EA	Manufacturing T For Use With: 13	c Nalgene Unwi echnology, for 1 3mm Tubes, Aut astic, Positions: nm, Diameter Op # 5970-0513	72, Description: T	ss: Resmer vrray: 6 x 12, Red, vable, Holds: 13 mm	20.30	20.3



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 10 of 34 Unit Extended UN Nbr Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price List Price: 63.70 CDC: 017 39 ΡK 14 823 30 SYR 1ML LR-LK W/O ND 100/PK RX 52.48 52.48 1 BD Disposable Syringes with Luer-Lok Tips, Volume: 1 mL, Needle Gauge: No Needle Included, Connection Type: Luer Tip, Disposable: Yes, Length: No Needle Included, Needle Point Number: No Needle Included, Recommended Applications: Healthcare, Sterile, Termination: Luer-lock Vendor Catalog # 309628 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 100 each per pack List Price: 91.90 CDC: 013 Medical Device 40 ΡK 14 823 435 SYRINGE LUER LOCK 3ML 200/PKRX 26.32 26.32 1 BD Disposable Syringes with Luer-Lok Tips, Volume: 3 mL, Connection Type: Luer Tip, Disposable: Yes, Latex Free: Yes, Recommended Applications: Healthcare, Sterile, Termination: Luer-lock Vendor Catalog # 309657 This item is being sold as 200 each per pack List Price: 37.60 CDC: 016 ΡK 14 829 45 SYRINGE ONLY LLOK 5ML 125/PKRX 21.77 21.77 41 1 BD Disposable Syringes with Luer-Lok Tips, Luer-Lok; Volume: 5mL, a dinimining Volume: 5 mL, Connection Type: Luer Tip, Disposable: Yes, Latex Free: Yes, Recommended Applications: Healthcare, Sterile, Termination: Luer-lock Vendor Catalog # 309646 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 125 each per pack List Price: 36.35 CDC: 014 Medical Device CS KIM KAP RED 13MM PP 1000/CS 14 957 92 98.21 42 98.21 1 DWK Life Sciences Kimble Kim-Kap Disposable Closures, Closure Color: Red, For Use With: 13mm O.D. plain-end culture tubes, Autoclavable: Yes, Polypropylene, Disposable: Yes Vendor Catalog # 73662-13 This item is being sold as 1000 each per case List Price: 156.20 CDC: 015



							Part of Th	ermo Fisher Scientifi	
						Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	ence	Page
						2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	376-25 RD	11 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog	Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
43	1	CS	14 96	Fisherbrand D x L: 13 x 100n Closure: KIM- Plain, Disposa chemistry Vendor Catalo This item is be List Price:	Disposable Borosili nm, Diameter Oute KAP, Non-sterile, A able: Yes, For Use og # 60C14-961-27 eing sold as 1000 139.70 CDC: 030	er: 13mm, Length: Autoclavable: Yes With: For tissue c 7 each per case	with Plain End, O.D. 100mm, Capacity: 10mL, Clear, Design Type: ulture and clinical		
44	1	CS	15 350	Thermo Scien Vertical, Holds in. (14.3 x 14 Storage Rack Vendor Catalo This item is be		ick, Dimensions: 5 Stainless Steel, C : 4/cs. ach per case	I.3 x 22.5cm, Design: .625 x 5.5 x 19.75	627.22	2 627.22
45	1	РК	19 099	Ansell MICRC Applications: I D5250, FDA 2 Finish: No Tex Yes, Exam, N Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y	OFLEX Derma Free Industrial, AQL: 1.5 21 CFR 177.2600, xture, Finger Thick on-sterile og # DF-850-S eing sold as 100 e 8.61 CDC: 177	5, Certifications/Co EN 420:2003 + A ² ness: 3.5 mil, 0.09	ves, Size: Small, mpliance: ASTM :2009, Clear, Exterior	4.92	2 4.92
46	1	РК	21 40	Thermo Scien graduated, De Force: 250000 bag, 10 bags/ Vendor Catalo	tific Snap Cap Lov escription: 2.0mL G (G, Capacity: 2mL unit, 10 units/ case	Graduated, Nonste , Polypropylene, P e, Non-sterile, Cap each per pack	entrifuge Tubes, 2mL, rile, Natural, Max. ackaging: 50 tubes/	50.28	50.28



				Quote N	lbr	Customer Reference	ce 🛛	Page
				2053-929	7-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376	-25 RD	12 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description			Unit Price	Extended Price
47	1	CS	Volume:10u; Col Needle, Flexible, Quantity: 250/Cs Disposable: Yes Vendor Catalog This item is bein	FB LP 10UL FLX LTYL IW posable Inoculating Loops a or: Yellow; Individual wrapp Paper Peel Pouch, Individu ., Volume: 10uL, Diameter # 22-363-600 g sold as 250 each per cas 06.20 CDC: 031	nd Nee ed, Inc ually wi Inside:	edles, Flexible Loop; culating Loop and apped, Packaging	39.35	39.35
48	1	CS	Inoculation Loop wrapped, Packay Inside: 0.035/0.1 Certificate of dim Vendor Catalog This item is bein	FB LP 1/10UL FLX WH IW posable Inoculating Loops a , Flexible, Natural, Paper Pe ging Quantity: 250/Cs., Volu 4 in., 0.09/0.38cm, Disposa tensional accuracy # 22-363-601 g sold as 250 each per cas 17.70 CDC: 031	nd Nee eel Pou ime: 1/ ble: Ye	edles, Combo ich, Individually 10uL, Diameter	41.14	41.14
49	1	CS	76.2mm), Length in., Quantity: 200 Vendor Catalog This item is bein	GZE SPNG 3X3IN 12PLY Gauze Sponges, Dimension 76.2mm, 3 in., Thickness Bag, Non-sterile, Absorba # 3124 g sold as 4000 each per ca 93.80 CDC: 038	ns: 3 x 12 ply ncy: Sta	3 in. (76.2 x , Width: 76.2mm, 3	74.70) 74.70
50	1	EA	80 x 155. Flask H the flask and 3 b maximize oxyger orbital shaker. D plastic closures, splashing that w Vendor Catalog This item is bein	6 BAFF SHAKE FLASK 25 0mL, 6 Baffles, Delong Nec has 6 baffles, 3 baffles on the affles on the bottom surface in transfer to the culture med elong style neck is made to while the longer neck reduc ould reach the closure. # CLS-2048-04 g sold as 1 per each -5.95 CDC: 053	k, App le lowe of the lium wl fit stair	r outside edge of flask to nen used on an nless steel or	41.19	9 41.19
51	NOBID)	*NO BID*					



38.97

67.94

30.27

80.68

					Quote Nbr	Customer Re	ference	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028	-1376-25 RD	13 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descrip	tion		Unit Price	Extended Price
52	1	EA	-	2-PROPANOL C 9.9%, C3H8O, CA ne, dimethylcarbin	S Number-67-63	-0, 2-propanol,	38.97	38.97
			1.00 AU max. at 0.025 AU max. a Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is being	t 254nm, 0.002% # BPA451-1 rial	max. at 220nm, 0 max.	ropanol, 1L,).13 AU max. at 230nn	١,	
53	1	EA	A508 P500	HYDROCHLOR	ACID TRCE MTI	_ 500ML	67.94	67.94
			hydrogen chlorid chlorhydrique, hy spirits of salt, hyd <-0.5ppb, 57 deg Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is being List Price: 13	rial g sold as 1 per 36.30 CDC: 154	cid, chlorwassers inhydrous hydroc cl, muriatic acid,).1ppb each	toff, acide :hloric acid, 500mL, <-1ppb,		
54	1	EA	AAA16205AP Glycerol >-99%	GLYCEROL, 99- C3H8O3, CAS N			30.27	30.27
			1,2,3-trihydroxyp alcohol, glycerito glycerine, 500mL 200-289-5, 160 c Vendor Catalog	ropane, 1,2,3-pro I, trihydroxypropa _, 635685, 182 de deg.C (320 deg.F)	panetriol, propar ine, glycerol, osm g.C (20mmHg), (), 92.09, Warning	netriol, glycyl noglyn, CHEBI:17754, 1.26,		
			List Price: 3	4.55 CDC: 033				
55	1	EA	AC148930010	ACETIC ACID G	LACIAL 99% 1 L	TR	80.68	80.68
			Acetic Acid, 99.8 acetique, ethano acid, methaneca	%, C2H4O2, CAS ic acid, acetic aci rboxylic acid, glac 0.02 max. at 280r eg.C, 02, 96 # 148930010	S Number-64-19- d, glacial, acetas cial, essigsaeure,	7, ethylic acid, acide ol, vinegar		



						Part of Ther	mo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-137	76-25 RD	14 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			This item is bein List Price: 9	g sold as 1 pe 2.10 CDC: 033	er each			
56	1	EA	trizma, trometam tromethamine, 2 trisamine, tham, Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 3Y This item is bein	nyl)aminometha Iol, tris hydroxyr amino-2-hydrox tris base, 1kg # 167620010	nethyl aminometh xymethyl propane- er each	INO3, CAS Number-77-86 ane, tris buffer,	116.16 -1,	116.16
57	1	EA	500-038-2, 270 c 60.0 deg.C, 15, Bottle, TQ41000 <-0.5% (K.F.) Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein	/col), CAS Num deg.C, 12 to 16n 7688, MFCD017 00, TSCA, 300-/ # 418050010	ng KOH/g, H(OCH 79615, Average N 450 mPa.s (20 deg	D 1KG PEG, 1kg, white flakes, I2CH2)nOH, 55.0 deg.C to I.W. 8000, Plastic g.C 50% in water),	79.19	79.15
58	2	EA	Format: Powder, Bottle, Grade: B Vendor Catalog This item is bein	c Agar, Bacterio For Use With: I acteriological # 443572500	RIOLOGICAL GR logical grade, Qua Microbial media, P er each	antity: 250g,	71.83	143.6
59	1	EA	BMA50001 Lonza SeaKem I Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein List Price: 1 Product - Non-R	LE Agarose, Qua # 50001 g sold as 1 pe 07.00 CDC: 086	er each	W EEO	80.25	80.2
60	1	EA	BMA50843 Vendor Catalog	10X TBE BUFF # 50843	FER 1LT		60.49	60.4



				Qu	uote Nbr	Customer Refer	rence	Page
				2053	3-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	376-25 RD	15 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description			Unit Price	Extended Price
				g sold as 1 per eacł /3.10 CDC: 083	1			
61	1	EA	Formulation: TA Loading Buffer, S Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate Shelf Life 6M This item is bein	Storage Requirements # 50844	entration: 10 M Tris aceta : 18 deg. to	te, 0.01M EDTA, DNA	85.39	85.39
62	1	EA	C10H18N2Na2C Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein	EDTA DISODIUM SA Tetraacetic Acid, Diso 010, CAS Number-638 # FLBP120-500 g sold as 1 per each 62.60 CDC: 081	odium Salt [1-92-6	0ihydrate, >-99.0%,	102.44	102.44
63	1	EA	BP1302 10	ETHIDIUM BROMIDI	E 10ML		62.81	62.81
			Ethidium Bromic Quantity: 10mL, Red, Grade: Mo Molecular Weigh Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is bein	e (1% Solution/Molect Packaging: Clear Bott lecular Biology, Molect nt: 394.316 # BP130210	ılar Biology) le, CAS: 12: ular Formula	39-45-8, 7732-18-5,		
64	1	EA	three elephant, h boron hydroxide Pressure: 2.7mb Gray, 0.001% m Vendor Catalog This item is bein		cic acid, boi it b, borofax %, 0.005% n	on trihydroxide, 500g, Vapor	50.34	50.34



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	876-25 RD	16 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
65	1	EA	sulfinylbis, dm sulfoxide, dem 100mL, <-0.30 20 deg.C, >-99 Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 2Y	oxide, >-99.7%, C so, demasorb, dir nsodrox, dimethyls) Absorbance Uni	nethyl sulphoxide, sulfoxide, dimexide ts at 280nm, Vapor 0 er each	per-67-68-5, methane, demavet, dimethyl	37.74	37.74
66	1	EA	1g (>-50U/mg) Vendor Catalo Hazardous Ma Shelf Life 2Y	igents Ribonuclea), Format: Powder og # BP25391	r, Source: Bovine p er each	1GM Pancreas), Quantity: ancreas, Off-White	539.60	539.60
67	1	EA	Monooleate, F 0.0001% max Test, 0.25% m Vendor Catalo	Polysorbate 80, 50 ., Gray, Amber, 0.	5-6, Polyoxyethyle 00mL, Vapor Press 0005% max., 1.080 0PE Bottle, Liquid, 0 er each	ure: <1hPa at 20 deg.C, 0g/cm3, 65 to 80, Pass	33.81	33.81
68	1	EA	rock salt, salin chloride, comr 440 deg.C, (D CHEBI:26710, Vendor Catalo	e, purex, sodium non salt, salt, hali ry Basis) >99.5%	a, CAS Number-76 chloride nacl, denc te, 1kg, Vapor Pres , >-99.0 %, 1461 de er each		45.86	45.86
69	1	EA	BP645 5		GL LDG DYE 30%G	GLY 5ML I-5, 7732-18-5, 5mL,	97.40	97.40
					to 0.45 AU, 0.25 to			



				Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Page
				2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-2	25 RD	17 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Molecular Biolog Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 2Y This item is being	ol (30%), Proprietary Component y, Contains 30% Glycerol, Poly B # FLBP645 5 g sold as 1 per each 54.60 CDC: 081			
70	1	EA	>-96 %, 1600 deg Certified, WARNI Vendor Catalog # This item is being		043-52-4, 500g, 2% max.,	157.00	157.00
71	1	EA	solution, anhydro anhydrous, d-glu 2r,3s,4r,5r-2,3,4, d-glucose in linea Vendor Catalog # This item is being	DEXTROSE ANHYD CERT ACS cose) Anhydrous, C6H12O6, CAS us dextrose, aldehydo-d-glucose cose, anhydrous, glucosteril, d +- 5,6-pentahydroxyhexanal, glucos ar form, 500g, CHEBI:42758 ¢ FLD16-500 g sold as 1 per each 30.60 CDC: 124	Number-50-99-7, dextrose , dextrose, glucose,	20.07	20.07
72	1	EA	BD Difco Dehydra Certifications/Cor With: Cultivation Packaging: Bottle Requirements: < Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 5Y This item is being	¢ 271310	7H9 Broth, t: Dehydrated, For Use ddlebrook 7H9 Broth,	236.84	236.84
73	1	CS	Fisherbrand Petri Raised Ridge, Di Color: Clear, Clos	PETRI DISH 100X15MM STACK i Dishes with Clear Lid, Raised rid ameter: 100mm, Height: 15mm, F sure Included: Yes, Edges: Raise eeves/Cs., 500 Dishes/Cs. # 431760	lge, Shape: Round, Polystyrene, Closure	53.10	53.10



						Part of Therm	o Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Referen	ce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376	6-25 RD	18 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Shelf Life 3Y This item is t List Price:	eing sold as 500 e 331.50 CDC: 031	-			
74	1	EA	cicloheximide neocyclohex 200-636-0, 2 Vendor Cata Hazardous M Shelf Life 1Y	e, kaken, naramycir imide, actidone, act 81.35, YPHMISFOI log # 0210018301 laterial	AS Number-66-81- a a, hizarocin, cyclo idion, 1g, >-94%, (CHEBI:27641, White,	81.57	81.57
75	1	EA	20mg, Conce Source: Bovi Use With: Us Vendor Cata Shelf Life 1Y	cals Deoxyribonucle entration: >-2,000Kl ne pancreas, Stora sed as a genetic ma log # 0210057520	J/mg, Format: Lyo ge Requirements: rker for forensic id er each	Pancreas, Quantity: ohilized Powder, 4 deg.C, White, For	317.28	317.28
76	1	EA		s a minimum order o B. POURITE TM AN log # 8-500		ipplier	74.33	74.33
77	NOBID)	*NO BID*					
78	1	EA	Purifies linea 100mL Wiza	zard DNA Cleanup r and circular DNA rd DNA cleanup res els, Storage Require log # A7280	from 200 to 50,000 in, 100 Wizard mir ements: 15 to 30 d er each	100 Preps, For Use With:)bp, Includes: nicolumns, 100 3cc	193.19	193.19



					Quote Nbr	Customer Referer	nce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-137	6-25 RD	19 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
79	1	EA	QKNYBSVHEM 2-amino-2-(hyd 93573, 15 to 30 Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 1Y This item is beir	IOAJP-UHFFFA(roxymethyl)propa deg.C, C(C(CO) # H5123	umber-1185-53-1, DYSA-N, ane-1,3-diol;hydroo)(CO)N)O.Cl er each	500g, 157.56, Molecular, hloride, 157.594,	140.16	140.16
80	1	EA	Number-6131-9 acetate tn, natri acetic acid, sod acetate usan:ja Vendor Catalog This item is beir	00-4, plasmafusin ium acetate-3-wa lium salt, trihydra n, thomaegelin, t) to 101.0%, C2H9 h, sodium acetate t isser, tutofusin, un te, sodium acetate 500g er each	ihydrate, sodium i-4550k0sc9b,	49.34	49.34
81	1	EA	soda, caustic, s caustic soda, so sodium hydroxi deg.C, >-97.0 % Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mat This item is beir	ide, >-97.0%, HN codium hydrate, a codium hydroxide de, white caustic 6, 1390 deg.C g # FLS318-100 erial	scarite, soda lye, a na oh, sodium hyd	1310-73-2, 497-19-8, aetznatron,	27.84	27.84
82	1	EA	Use With: Provi 8.75 in., 22.9 cr Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mat This item is bein	ides up to 5 hours n, Recommende I # 65 erial	-		52.73	52.73



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	376-25 RD	20 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
83	1	EA		ed LPG Burner Buta Burner, LPG, Recor og # 65F aterial	mmended Applicat er each	With: Replacement	15.98	15.98
84	NOBID		*NO BID*	02 717 350				
85	NOBID		*NO BID*	02 717 352				
86	NOBID		*NO BID*	02 717 351				
87	NOBID		*NO BID*	19 005 427				
88	1	PK	Diameter: 12 linters, Ashles Filtration Spe 100Pack, Thi Vendor Catal	nan Grade 589/3 Q 5mm, Format: Circl ss Quantitative Filte		igh-quality cotton ight: 84g/m2,	65.89	65.89
89	1	EA	Length: 125 f cost-effective and caps, and	t., 38 m, Sealing Fi covering, over wra d shelf or tray liner Thermoplastic og # PM996	rapping Film, Widtl ilm, Applications: E ap to further secure to prevent slipping er each	fficient and stoppers, lids,	71.70	71.70
90	1	EA	algrain, ethyl alcohol, tecso (v/v), 2ppm m	.5%, C2H6O, CAS alcohol, alkohol, m ol, alcohol, anhydro	BIOLOGY GRADE Number-64-17-5, hethylcarbinol, ethy bl, 500mL, Pass Te EBI:16236, Red, C	ethyl hydroxide, l hydrate, grain st, Assay: >-99.5%	34.61	34.61



				Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	e	Page
				2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-	25 RD	21 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Hazardous Mater This item is being List Price: 9				
91	1	EA	7791-18-6, magn anhydrous, magn dichloride, magne max., >-99.0 %, (Vendor Catalog # This item is being		Mg, CAS Number-7786-30-3, nesium chloride, oride, magnesium 2+ ion	64.95	64.95
92	1	EA	Agar, Powder / F Quantity: 500g, F solidifying agent f Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being		se With: Used for a	152.46	152.46
93	1	EA	Poly Bottle, Quar in a form readily a Molecular genetic Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being		Use With: Nitrogen	62.35	62.35
94	1	EA	Fisherbrand Anal 120V, Amperage Exterior: 7.97 in., Exterior: 4.75 in., (20.2 x 12.1 x 12) Vendor Catalog # This item is being	# 80863016	3200rpm, Voltage: , 12.7cm, Length ., 4.5kg, Width	202.70	202.70



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 22 of 34 Unit Extended Qty UN Nbr **Catalog Number** Description Price Price 5425, KE, WITHOUT ROTOR, 120V 95 EA 13 864 457 2,332.40 2,332.40 1 Eppendorf Centrifuge 5425, Controller Type: Keypad, Capacity: 24 x 1.5/2 mL, 10 x 5 mL, Max. RCF: 21,300 x g, Max. Speed: 15,060 rpm, Product Line: Frontier 5000 Series Mini, Refrigerated: No, Amperage: 15 A, Certifications/Compliance: UL and cUL, Depth: 15.4 in., 39 cm, Drive System: Direct Vendor Catalog # 5405000247 This item is being sold as 1 per each 3,400.00 CDC: 011 List Price: 96 EA FBE00020 FISHERBRAND FLITE 2-20UL 161.08 161.08 1 Fisherbrand Elite Adjustable-Volume Pipettors, 2-20uL, Accuracy: 1 to 3%, Volume: 2 to 20 uL, Increments: 0.02uL, Autoclavable: Autoclavable, Compatible Tips: SureOneTM tips, Finger Style: Ergonomic, Includes: Calibration certificate, in-lab calibration tool Vendor Catalog # 4680030 This item is being sold as 1 per each 337.50 CDC: 016 List Price: 97 ΕA FBE00200 **FISHERBRAND ELITE 20-200UL** 174.48 174.48 1 Fisherbrand Elite Adjustable-Volume Pipettors, 20-200uL, Accuracy: 0.6 to 1.8%, Volume: 20 to 200 uL, Increments: 0.2uL, Autoclavable: Autoclavable, Compatible Tips: SureOneTM tips, Finger Style: Ergonomic, Includes: Calibration certificate, in-lab calibration tool Vendor Catalog # 4680060 This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 337.50 CDC: 016 98 13 683C **PIPET DEVICE 10ML GREEN** 31.47 31.47 1 EA Bel-Art SP Scienceware Pipette Pump Pipetters, Green, Volume: 10 mL, For Use With: Pipets, Resistance: Acid and Alkali Vendor Catalog # F37898-0000 This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 56.70 CDC: 020 BTL MEDIA PYREX 100ML 10/CS 99 CS 06 414 1A 55.08 55.08 1 PYREX Reusable Media Storage Bottles, Capacity: 3.3 oz., 100 mL, Mouth: Narrow, Quantity: 10/Cs., Closure Size: GL45, Orange, Borosilicate Glass, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Orange, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Screw Cap, Diameter: 2.2 in., 56 mm, Graduations: 40 to 80 mL



						Part of Ther	mo Fisher Scientific	
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	nce	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-137	76-25 RD	23 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
				# 1395-100 ng sold as 10 e 37.00 CDC: 063				
100	1	CS	Capacity: 3.3 oz to 80mL, Height Non-sterile, Clos Closure Type: S Vendor Catalog This item is bein	usable Glass Me ., 100 mL, Diam : 3.9 in., 100mm sure Color: Blue,	eter: 2.2 in., 56mn , Closure Size: GL , Closure Material:	ap, Capacity: 100mL, n, Graduations: 20 45, Natural,	57.36	57.3
101	1	CS	oz., 250 mL, Mc Orange, Borosil Closure Materia 2.7 in., 70 mm Vendor Catalog This item is beir	le Media Storage outh: Wide, Quan icate Glass, Non I: Polypropylene	ntity: 10/Cs., Closu -sterile, Closure C , Closure Type: So ach per case	8 oz.), Capacity: 8.45 re Size: GL45,	61.99	61.9
102	1	CS	Capacity: 8.45 c to 200mL, Heigh Non-sterile, Clos Closure Type: S Vendor Catalog This item is bein	usable Glass Me oz., 250 mL, Diar nt: 5.4 in., 138mr sure Color: Blue, screw	neter: 2.7 in., 70m n, Closure Size: G , Closure Material: ach per case	ap, Capacity: 250mL, m, Graduations: 50 L45, Natural,	63.66	63.6
103	1	CS	Mouth: Wide, Q Borosilicate Gla Material: Polypr 86mm, Gradua Vendor Catalog	le Media Storage uantity: 10/Cs., 0 ss, Non-sterile, 0 opylene, Closure tions: 100 to 400) mL	/: 17 oz., 500 mL, 5, Orange,	75.00	75.0



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 24 of 34 Extended Unit UN Nbr Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price 180.70 CDC: 063 List Price: 104 1 CS FB800500 MEDIA BTL GS GL45 500 ML 10/CS 71.82 71.82 Fisherbrand Reusable Glass Media Bottles with Cap, Capacity: 500mL, Capacity: 17 oz., 500 mL, Diameter: 3.3 in., 86mm, Graduations: 100 to 400mL, Height: 6.9 in., 176mm, Closure Size: GL45, Natural, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Blue, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Screw Vendor Catalog # FS14395-500 This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 119.70 CDC: 018 CS 06 414 1D **BTL MEDIA PYREX 1L 10/CS** 105 1 91.27 91.27 PYREX Reusable Media Storage Bottles, 1L, Capacity: 33.8 oz., 1000 mL, 1 L, Mouth: Narrow, Quantity: 10/Cs., Closure Size: GL45, Orange, Borosilicate Glass, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Orange, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Plug Seal, Diameter: 3.9 in., 101 mm Vendor Catalog # 1395-1L This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 222.50 CDC: 063 106 CS FB8001000 MEDIA BTL GS GL45 1000ML 10/CS 94.50 94.50 1 Fisherbrand Reusable Glass Media Bottles with Cap, Capacity: 1000mL, Capacity: 33.8 oz., 1000 mL, Diameter: 3.9 in., 101mm, Graduations: 100 to 900mL, Height: 8.8 in., 225mm, Closure Size: GL45, Natural, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Blue, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Screw Vendor Catalog # FS14395-1000 This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 157.50 CDC: 018 107 1 CS 02 555 2 **BEAKR STARTER PACK NO1 1/CS** 37.78 37.78 DWK Life Sciences Kimble KIMAX Low Form, Griffin, Starter Pack, Capacity: 50 mL, 100 mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, and 1000 mL, Borosilicate Glass, Accuracy: +/-5%, Certifications/Compliance: USP, ASTM E438 Vendor Catalog # 14080-01 This item is being sold as 1 per case

List Price: 56.60 CDC: 062



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refer	rence	Page	
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	376-25 RD	25 of 34	
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price	
108	1	EA	Fisherbrand Octa in., 8mm, Length Dimensions: 2 x Octagonal, Certif Quantity: 50, Stir Vendor Catalog # This item is being	agon Spinbar M : 2 in., 50.8mm, 0.31 in. (50.8 x ications/Compli bar, Width: 0.3 # 37110-5002	1 in., 8mm	rs, Diameter: 0.31 s, White,	6.91	6.91	
109	1	EA	Mettler Toledo N Capacity: 1200 g Certifications/Con Type: Backlit LCI Vendor Catalog # This item is being	, Readability: 0 mpliance: ISO/0 D, Electrical Re # 30029122	Precision Balances .01 g, Stabilization GLP, Connection T quirements: 100/2 er each	ype: RS-232, Display	1,039.50	1,039.50	
110	1	PK	75 003 839	ADPT PRP BU	FFY COAT BAG P	K/2	218.79	218.79	
			Adapter for Oval Platelet-rich Plas 6/8 x 250mL, For Vendor Catalog # This item is being	Single Blood B ma or Buffy Co Use With: Ova # 75003839		ption: 250mL et of 2), Capacity:			
111	1	EA	Eppendorf Scient Shakers Package deg.F, 7 to 60 de in., Voltage: 120/ Universal platforr Vendor Catalog # This item is being	tific Excella E24 e, Model: Excell g.C, Length Pla 100V, Width Pla n # M1352-0010	la E24, Temperatu atform: 18 in., 45.7 atform: 18 in., 45.7 er each		6,830.92	6,830.92	



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	rence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	376-25 RD	26 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	ption		Unit Price	Extended Price
112	1	EA	Block, Electrica Steel, Relative to 130 deg.C, C Type: PID Vendor Catalog This item is bei	otemp Digital Dry al Requirements: 1 Humidity: <80%, Certifications/Com	100/120 V, 50/60 H Temperature Rang pliance: CE, cULu er each	20V ers, No. of Places: 1 Hz, Powder-coated ge: Ambient +5 deg.C s, RoHS, Controller	312.37	312.37
113	1	EA	Ambient +5 de Chamber: 6.7 i	vigital Water Bath, g. to 99 deg.C, Co n., 17 cm Chambe ons: 29 x 38 x 23 o 'cover)	ontroller Type: PID er, Depth: 29 cm, I	Temperature Range:	756.97	756.97
114	1	EA	13 998 035 13 998 035 Thermo Scient Description: Sin Electrical Require ft., Chamber M Humidity: >909 Vendor Catalog This item is bein List Price: 14 Medical Device Product - Non-	ing sold as 1 pe 978.50 CDC: 010 HERA150I CO2 ific Heracell 150i (ngle 150L incubate lirements: 120 V, 4 laterial: Electropol % at 37 deg.C g # 51026406 ing sold as 1 pe 1,760.00 CDC: 99 e Returnable	2 SST IR 120V CO2 Incubator, IR or, CO2 Sensor Te 50/60 Hz, Capacit ished Stainless St er each 9	echnology: IR sensor, /: 150 L, 5.3 cu.	10,161.95	10,161.9
115	1	EA	UVP97019204 UVP97019204 UVP MultiDoc- Transilluminato colorimetric ima	IMAGING SYS It Imaging System or: M-20, Voltage: aging, Wavelength g # 97-0192-04	RRANTY INCUBA 		== 6,510.20	6,510.2



						Part of I		
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refe	erence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	1376-25 RD	27 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
			List Price:	7,570.00 CDC: 010	0			
116	1	EA	Cord Vendor Catalo This item is be List Price: Extended wa 70 168 1700 70 105 6239	og # 840-281700 eing sold as 1 pe 2,790.00 CDC: 010 erranty available fo SPECTRONIC 2 UNITY BASIC E	200; Thermo Scier er each 0 r purchase below: 200 EXTENDED V DEPOT WAR SPE		2,257.18	2,257.1
117	1	EA	Amperage: 40 Use With: SDS	lectrophoresis Pow 0 mA, Voltage: 30 S-PAGE, DGGE/C ions: 10.25 x 5.5 x og # FB300Q	0 V, Electrical Rec DGE and DNA/RN 5.25 in. (26 x 14 x er each	pact Power Supplies, uirements: 120 V, For A, 13.3 cm), Display:	522.16	522.1
118	1	EA	Description: G 38 x 11cm, Ce 14.94 x 4.38 in 13.75 in., 35 c Vendor Catalo This item is be	tific Owl A6 Wide (Sel size: 23 x 25cm ertifications/Compli n. (35 x 38 x 11 cm cm og # A6	ו; Buffer volume: 3 iance: CE marked, ח), Height: 4.38 in., er each	ctrophoresis System, L; L x W x H: 35 x Dimensions: 13.75 x	959.80	959.8
119	NOBIE)	*NO BID*					
120	1	EA	Capacity: 5 cu Amperage: 1.	tific Value Lab Und I. ft., 141.6 L, Elect 1 A, Casters: 2 Adj ations/Compliance:	trical Requirement justable Feet In Fr	s: 115 V 60 Hz, ont, 2 Fixed Pads In	1,605.60	1,605.60



				Quo	te Nbr	Customer Re	ference	Page
				2053-5	9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028	-1376-25 RD	28 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	· ·		Unit Price	Extended Price
			Hazardous Ma This item is be List Price: 2					
			Extended war 14 259 180 70 105 6239	ranty available for purcha EXTENDED WARRANT UNITY BASIC DEPOT V	se below: Y BASIC LR VAR SPEC	/F \$695.00 200 \$422.50		
121	1	EA	-	-	se solution f	or making your	80.40	80.4
122	1	EA	Plate Width: 7 2500rpm, Volta 13.3 x 11.1cm) in., 11.1cm, He Vendor Catalo This item is be		Length: 7 in Aluminum, 25 x 5.25 x	Speed: 250 to 4.375 in. (21 x	243.03	243.0
123	1	EA	Grade, proteas Lyophilized Po Regulatory Sta Vendor Catalo This item is be	-	n Fraction V 0, Quantity: ilized powde	, 98%, Immunoassay 100g, Format: er, Recombinant: No,		213.7
124	1	EA	of Places: 18, Digital and Tou	FS MIXED BLOCK 1.5 / erbrand Isotemp Digital D Aluminum Alloy, For Use V ich Screen Dry Baths/Bloc nL and 2.0 mL, Accessory, g # 88860113	ry Baths/Blo Nith: Therm k Heaters (o Scientific	75.69 ,	75.6



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2053-9297-76 29 of 34 Extended Unit UN Nbr Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price This item is being sold as 1 per each 106.70 CDC: 005 List Price: 05 400 008 24-PL A-T ROTOR+LID F/ 5424 125 ΕA 949.42 949.42 1 Eppendorf Model 5424 Microcentrifuge Rotors, Standard Rotor, Includes: Aerosol-tight lid, Capacity: 24 x 1.5/2mL, For Use With: 5430 Microcentrifuge, Max. RCF: 21,130 x g, Max. Speed: 15,000rpm, Angle: Fixed, No. of Places: 24, Radius: 8.4cm Vendor Catalog # 022653008 This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 1,384.00 CDC: 011 126 ΕA BP1422 500 YEAST EXTRACT DEHYDRATED 500G 116.87 116.87 1 Fisher BioReagents Microbiology Media Additives: Yeast Extract, Quantity: 500g, Format: Dehydrated, Media Type: Yeast Extract, Packaging: Poly Bottle, Description: Bacterial Culture, Grade: Molecular genetics Vendor Catalog # BP1422500 Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 185.50 CDC: 081 ΡK 02 202 101 WEIGH BOATS MEDIUM 500/PK 34.91 127 1 34.91 Fisherbrand Hexagonal Polystyrene Weighing Dishes, Depth: 15 mm, Diameter Inner Base: 47 mm, Diameter Inner Top: 67 mm, Weight: 1.4 g, For Use With: Design provides greater balance, protection and safety, Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 02202101 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack List Price: 127.50 CDC: 021 02 202 103 128 1 PK WEIGH BOATS XLG 500/PK 114.17 114.17 Fisherbrand Hexagonal Polystyrene Weighing Dishes, Depth: 32 mm, Diameter Inner Base: 92 mm, Diameter Inner Top: 132 mm, Weight: 7.1 g, For Use With: Design provides greater balance, protection and safety, Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 02202103 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack List Price: 488.50 CDC: 021



					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	30 of 34
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descri	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price
129	1	EA	cm Vendor Catal	NATURAL GAS n Burners, Basic, D log # CH0991NG/R peing sold as 1 po 57.10 CDC: 013	SD er each		22.63	22.63
130	1	CS	mL, Borosilic Baffled, Diam Vendor Catal	-	vable: Autoclavable 38 mm ach per case	Flasks, Capacity: 250 , Bottom Shape:	143.00	143.00
131	1	CS	mL, Borosilic Baffled, Diam Vendor Catal		vable: Autoclavable 3.8 cm ach per case	Flasks, Capacity: 1000 , Bottom Shape:	255.48	255.48
132	1	CS	Closure Colo Polypropylen Disposable: M mLess necks Vendor Catal	CLOSURE DSI propylene Flask Clo r: Natural, Autoclav e, Closure Type: C No, For Use With: C s, No. per Case: 100 log # 26797-38 being sold as 100 o 340.00 CDC: 063	rable: Autoclavable losure, Diameter C Culture tubes and fl D/Cs. each per case	outer Neck: 3.8 cm, , Closure Material: outer: 38 mm,	210.80	210.80
133	1	EA	Includes: PR- verification so Power Cable Vendor Catal This item is b List Price:	ntific NanoDrop On -1 pedestal condition olution, USB memo , Warranty: 2 year log # 840-274100 peing sold as 1 pe 12,150.00 CDC: 99	oning solution, PV- ry device, Microfib er each 99	-Vis Spectrophotometer,	12,150.00	12,150.00



					Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific				
					Quote Nbr	Customer Refere	ence	Page	
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-13	76-25 RD	31 of 34	
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price	
			70 105 8111 N 70 105 8112 N 70 105 8108 N	VANODROP O VANODROP D VANODROP O		CERT \$2650.00	=		
134	1	EA	Magnesium Sulfa acid magnesium ot, magnesium su sulfate 1:1, magn max., CHEBI:325 Vendor Catalog # This item is being	ate Anhydrous, salt 1:1, mgso- ulphate, bitter s sesium sulfate a 599, Gray, Whit # FLM65-500	4, sal de sedlitz, sa salt, magnesium su anhydrous, 500g, (e er each	nber-7487-88-9, sulfuric Il angalis, tomix	71.91	71.9	
135	1	EA	1mL, Concentrati Vendor Catalog # Hazardous Mater Shelf Life 4Y This item is being	on: >600 U/mL # EO0491 rial	recombinant, PCF . (∼20 mg/mL) er each	•	59.94	59.9	
136	1	CS	CELLTREAT Scie Bio-reaction tube scale, high densit reaction application maintained throug screening and op parameters can be maximizing the n simultaneously. It seeding larger bio for larger bioreac graduations and a non-pyrogenic. M	entific Products s offer a conve ty suspension of ons and free ga gh 0.22µm hyd trimization proc be optimized us umber of parall deal for susper preactors, supp tors, and lyoph a large white m lax force (RCF) r quality tracea ag, 100/case.	nient and economic cell culture. Ideal for as exchange. Asep rophobic vented m resses of suspensi- sing small amounts	n Tube Self Standing. ical option for small or biological otic conditions nembrane. Useful in the on cells. Reaction a of materials, at can be performed vacterial growth, ting procedures ead black se/DNase free and ase is printed with	147.80	147.8	



					Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific				
	C					Customer Refe	rence	Page	
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1	376-25 RD	32 of 34	
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descript	ion		Unit Price	Extended Price	
				ng sold as 100 ea 186.00 CDC: 053	ch per case				
137	1	EA	White, Pass Tes OOYGSFOGFJ Vendor Catalog This item is beir	st, >250 deg.C, 582 DDHP-IZQIRFRQS	5S, CAS Numbe 2.58, < 1.0%, SA-N	5G er-25389-94-0, 5g, Gray,	62.81	62.81	
138	1	EA	inducer of the te vectors pASK-IE activity within ou Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate		of tetracycline a er present in E. c It does not exhi	nd an efficient oli expression	155.87	155.87	
139	1	EA	500g, Format: E casein is used a Tryptone, Packa Grade: Molecula Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 3Y This item is beir	Dehydrated Powder as a nitrogen sourc aging: Poly Bottle, ar genetics	Media Additives: r, For Use With: e for bacteria, M Description: Bac		136.40	136.40	
140	NOBIE)	*NO BID*						
141	1	EA	to the gel slice of transfer to the s for organic dena Fast-Spin colum minutes. DNA p is perfectly suite	ZYMOCLEAN GE specially formulate containing your DN upplied Zymo-Spin aturants or chlorofo on technology to yie ourified using the Zy ed for use in DNA li eactions, PCR, etc.	d Agarose Disso A sample, let dis ™ Column orm. Instead, the eld high-quality I ymoclean™	olving Buffer (ADB) solve, and then . There is no need product utilizes DNA in just 15 ; Gel DNA Recovery Kit	82.40	82.40	



					Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific				
					Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	e	Page	
					2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376	-25 RD	33 of 34	
Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Descr	iption		Unit Price	Extended Price	
			Vendor Catalog List Price: 9	# D4001 2.00 CDC: 053					
142	1	EA	2225532, CHEB Statement H WIIZWVCIJKGZ 2,2-dichloro-N-[(Vendor Catalog This item is bein	l, >-99%, C11H l:17698, 200-28 350-H361, P20 OK-RKDXNWH 1R,2R)-1,3-dihy # B20841-14	97-4, 323.14, H350 1-P202-P281-P309 RSA-N, rdroxy-1-(4-nitroph er each	Number-56-75-7, 25g, 0.99, , GHS H	47.57	47.57	
143	1	PK	Consumable; Ele gap size, 50 indiv Vendor Catalog	ectroporation; S vidually sealed	cuvettes, sterile	MM 50P ation cuvettes, 1 mm	93.00	93.00	
144	1	EA	alkaline lysis sys resuspension ste procedures. Sim directly to your b Zymo-Spin colur buffers included cell lysis and neu fastest and easie Coli efficiently. T and well suited for restriction endon sequencing, and Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is being	nid Miniprep Kit tem that bypass aps common to ply add the unic acterial culture, nn technology. , in the kit allow f utralization. The est method avai he plasmid DN/ or use in transfe uclease digestion other sensitive # D4020 rial	A is high quality, en action, bacterial tra on, DNA ligation, F downstream appli er each	ree modified -pelleting and oreparation K Lysis Buffer en purify with atented colored on of complete iniprep Kit is the lasmid DNA from E. ndotoxin-free, nsformation, PCR, transcription,	335.70	335.70	



Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr	Customer Reference	Page
2053-9297-76	RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD	34 of 34

Nbr	Qty	UN	Catalog Number	Description	Unit Price	Extended Price
145	1	EA	sequencing-r formulated D to the supplie denaturants o column techn in just 2 minu sequencing, I	DNA CLEAN AND CONC-25 200 PREP e used for post-RT cDNA clean-up and purification of eady DNA from M13 phage. Simply add the specially NA Binding Buffer to your sample and transfer the mixture ad Zymo-Spin™ Column. There is no need for organic or chloroform. Instead, the product features ZymoSpin tology to yield DNA that is free of salts and contaminants tes. The purified DNA is ideal for DNA ligation, abeling, PCR, microarray, transfection, transformation, n digestion procedures. og # D4006 294.00 CDC: 053	244.90	244.90
146	1	EA	miroscopy. 1 atitrantin stro forms an insc are water-sol	-	51.60	51.60
			Conta Hazar	CHANDISE TOTAL ainer/Ice Charges rdous Material Charge ack Fee		58,356.82 33.00 28.00 12.00 58,429.82

NOTES:

Returns are subject to manufacturer terms and conditions.

We now offer highly competitive financing with low monthly payments. Please contact your local sales representative for more information.

Tell us about your recent customer service experience by completing a short survey. This should take no longer than three minutes. Enter the link into your browser and enter the passcode: USA-PGH-CS2 http://survey.medallia.com/fishersci