| *Quote Nbr | Creation Date | Due Date | Page | | | |
|---|------------------|---|--------------|--|--|--|
| 2152-1346-81 | 06/01/2022 | | 1 of 34 | | | |
| Payment | Terms | Delivery Terms | | | | |
| NET 30 | DAYS | DE | ST | | | |
| Valio | d To | Prepar | ed By | | | |
| 09/29/ | 2022 | SHERDEL, RON | | | | |
| Customer | Reference | Sales Rep | presentative | | | |
| RFQ REQTE 10 | 28-1376-25 RD | RONALD SHERDEL | | | | |
| To place an order | Ph: 800-766-7000 | Fx: 80 | 0-926-1166 | | | |
| Submit | ted To: | Customer Account | : 374633-070 | | | |
| TIFFANY MORAND MORANDT@HHMI.OR 301-215-8589 | G | HHMI UMBC DEPT 1000 HILLTOP CIF BALTIMORE MD 2 ATTN: TIFFANY M | RCLE 1250 | | | |



FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LLC 4500 TURNBERRY DRIVE HANOVER PARK IL 60133-5491

Review and Place Order

Click here or go through your purchasing system to fishersci.com quotes

*Please reference this Quote Number on all correspondence.

Don't have a profile? Register on fishersci.com

For complete Terms and Conditions, please click here.

| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|---------------|-------------------|
| 1 | 1 | EA | 46cm, 18 in., samples | ALUMINUM FOIL 18IN X 50FT Aluminum Foil, Length: 50 ft., Thickness: 0.024mm, Width: Applications: For sealing, weighing, and transferring og # 75SQ.FT eing sold as 1 per each 42.20 CDC: 017 | 16.68 | 16.68 |
| 2 | 1 | PK | Width: 9cm, 3 Thickness: 2 Vendor Catal Shelf Life 3Y | og # SCSF eing sold as 200 each per pack 85.10 CDC: 182 | 31.29 | 31.29 |
| 3 | 1 | CS | Caps, Capac Quantity: 12, Yes, Closure Vendor Catal | JAR CLR ST SD W/PTFE 16OZ 12CS Clear Straight Sided Glass Jars with White Polypropylene ity: 480 mL, 16 oz., Closure Liner: PE Foam/PTFE, Glass (Type 3), Closure Color: White, Closure Included: Material: Polypropylene, Neck Finish: 89-400 og # W014216 eing sold as 12 each per case 214.50 CDC: 021 | 48.07 | 48.07 |



| | | | | | | | lenno Fisher Scientinc | |
|-----|-------|----|--|--|--|--|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | rence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | 376-25 RD | 2 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Numbe | er Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 4 | 1 | EA | pump, laborat Each, l Vendo | Bacdown Hand Soap, Si Boiling Point: >212 deg.F ory personnel, Fragrance Recommended Application r Catalog # 7001 em is being sold as 1 p | F, Format: Liquid, F e: Almond, pH Ran ons: Safety per each | kaging: Bottle, one for Use With: For | 23.44 | 23.44 |
| 5 | NOBID | | *NO BID* | | | | | |
| 6 | 1 | PK | Force: | TUBES 1.5ML dorf Snap-Cap Microcent 30000xG, Packaging: 50 Diameter Outer: 10mm, | 0/Pk., Autoclavable | ubes, Natural, Max. e: Yes, Capacity: | 35.47 | 35.47 |
| | | | Vendo This ite List Pri | | each per pack | | | |
| 7 | 1 | CS | Closure Gradua Sterile, Spot, L Vendo Shelf L | orand Higher-Speed 50m e Type: Flat Cap, Packag ations: Yes, Includes: Bla Diameter Outside: 1.1 ir ength: 115mm r Catalog # 431263 ife 3Y em is being sold as 500 | ging: Rack, Capacit ick graduations, PF n., 28mm, Label Ty each per case | stic Centrifuge Tubes, y: 1.69 oz., 50mL, ? (Polypropylene), | 136.97 | 136.97 |
| 8 | 1 | PK | Centrif Outside (Polyca Bottom Vendo | o Scientific Nalgene Oak uge Tubes, 50mL, With s e: 28.8mm, Autoclavable arbonate), No. per Pack: n Shape: Round, Closure r Catalog # 3118-0050 em is being sold as 10 e | screw caps; Capaci : Yes, Graduations 10, Non-sterile, Wr : Included each per pack | Polycarbonate ty: 50mL, Diameter : None, PC | 53.75 | 53.75 |



| | | | | | Part of Therm | o Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|--|---------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Referen | ce | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376 | 5-25 RD | 3 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 9 | 1 | CS | 05 539 1215M TBE PP/FFisherbrand Easy Reader Conic Capacity: 15mL, 0.50 oz., Closu Sterile, Clear, Graduations: 0.5r (Polypropylene), No. per Pack: 4 Label Type: White Marking Spo Vendor Catalog # 430885 This item is being sold as 500 | ire Type: Flat Cap, nL, Includes: Black 50, Diameter Outsi t each per case | Centrifuge Tubes, Packaging: Racked, graduations, PP | 117.22 | 117.22 |
| 10 | 1 | РК | 03 448 20 96WELL TUB Fisherbrand 96-Well PCR Tube 3.8cm), Assorted (Blue, Green, Autoclavable, Yes, Polypropyler mm, Includes: Removable, hing Vendor Catalog # HS23461AF This item is being sold as 5 e List Price: 83.60 CDC: 020 | Orange, Pink, Yell ne, PCR Rack, Dep ed lid ach per pack | .5 in. H (12.7 x 10.1 x ow), Autoclavable: | 35.65 | 35.65 |
| 11 | 1 | CS | 09 761 141 1LFLTSYS 0.5 Corning Disposable Vacuum Fil Membrane Material: Cellulose A 54.5cm2, Volume Receiver: 100 Disposable: Yes Vendor Catalog # 431205 Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as 12 e List Price: 376.00 CDC: 043 | Acetate, Volume: 50 00mL, Connectors: each per case | ns, Pore Size: 0.2um, 00mL, Filtration Area: | 147.70 | 147.70 |
| 12 | 1 | CS | 09 761 34 FLTR TUBE TO Corning Centrifuge Tube Top Va 0.22 um, Volume: 150 mL, Inclu 50 mL polypropylene receiver co stands, orange HDPE plug seal Vendor Catalog # 430320 Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as 12 e List Price: 131.60 CDC: 018 | ides: 150 mL polys entrifuge tube, two , Polystyrene, Cellu each per case | Membrane, Pore Size: tyrene filter funnel, centrifuge tube | 54.46 | 54.46 |



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | nce | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 76-25 RD | 4 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 13 | 1 | РК | Filter Material: MBS/Polypropy Connectors: Do cm, Diameter M Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 2Y This item is bei | Steriflip Sterile D Polyethersulfone /lene, Polyethers puble lead thread | | Filter Units, 0.22 um, mL, Clear, Diameter Filter: 4 | 119.86 | 119.86 |
| 14 | 1 | РК | Diameter: 110 Porosity: 6um, Description: Gr 110 mm Vendor Catalog | n Qualitative Gra mm, Format: Circ Filter Paper, Airfl ade 3 Qualitative | eles, Grade: Grade ow Rate: 26sec./10 Filter Paper Stand | nd Sheets - Grade 3, 3, Cellulose, 00mL/sq. in., | 27.46 | 27.46 |
| 15 | 1 | РК | Dimensions: 80 Graduations: 0 on each strip, c Quantity: 100P Vendor Catalog | n pH Indicator Pa) x 6mm, Color Bo .5 pH units, Includ complementary in ack | onded, pH Test Str des: Plastic suppor dicator charts, Len | H Range: 4.5 to 10, ip, Format: Strip, ts, paper segments | 24.33 | 24.33 |
| 16 | 1 | РК | Pore Size: 0.2u 25 mm Sterile Disposable: Ye Vendor Catalog This item is bei | n GD/X Sterile P ım, Autoclavable: Syringe Filter, PE ıs, Filtration Area: | Yes, Volume: >10 S filtration medium 4.6 cm2 each per pack | Diameter: 25 mm, mL, Description: GD/X | 193.94 | 193.94 |



| | | | | | Part of Thermo F | Isner Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|---|--|---|------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-2 | 5 RD | 5 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number Des | cription | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 17 | 1 | CS | 10 041 5BFLSK BAF EPYREX Narrow Mouth Erlenn 250 mL, Borosilicate Glass, B Description: Top style: Tooled Use With: Ideal for shaker cull Style: Narrow Vendor Catalog # 4450-250 This item is being sold as | ottom Shape: Baffled I, Diameter Outer: 3.3 tures, Height: 6.1 in., e each per case | vith Baffles, Capacity: J, Closure Size: 6, 3 in., 85 mm, For | 215.04 | 215.04 |
| 18 | 1 | CS | 10 530FLSK PETGThermo Scientific Nalgene SiBaffled Bottom: Sterile, 250mClosure Size: 38-430 mm, Cloper Pack: 1, Shape: ErlenmeyVendor Catalog # 4116-0250Shelf Life 5YThis item is being sold as 1List Price: 227.50 CDC: CMedical Device | L, vented, Capacity: osure Type: Vent, No ver, Surface Coating: 2 each per case | nmeyer Flasks with 250 mL, 8 oz., . per Case: 12, No. | 145.58 | 145.58 |
| 19 | 1 | CS | 10 531 FLSK PETG Thermo Scientific Nalgene Si Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 500m Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Cloper Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmey Vendor Catalog # 4116-0500 Shelf Life 5Y This item is being sold as 1: List Price: 287.00 CDC: 0 Medical Device 10 531 | L, vented, Capacity: osure Type: Vent, No /er, Surface Coating: 2 each per case | nmeyer Flasks with 500 mL, 16 oz., . per Case: 12, No. | 185.92 | 185.92 |
| 20 | 1 | CS | Thermo Scientific Nalgene Si Baffled Bottom: Sterile, 1000r Closure Size: 45-430 mm, Clo Pack: 1, Shape: Erlenmeyer, Vendor Catalog # 4116-1000 Shelf Life 5Y | nL, vented, Capacity osure Type: Vent, No Surface Coating: No each per case | meyer Flasks with : 1000 mL, 32 oz., . per Case: 6, No. per | 129.57 | 129.57 |



| | | | | | | | Part of T | Thermo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|---------|--|--|--|---|--------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | erence | Page |
| | | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028- | 1376-25 RD | 6 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog | g Number | Desci | ription | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 21 | 2 | CS | 10 | Baffled Bottom Closure Size: - Pack: 1, Shape Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y | tific Nalgene Sing 1: Sterile, 2000mL 45-430 mm, Clos e: Erlenmeyer, Su 1: g # 4116-2000 1: g sold as 4 e 1: 49.50 CDC: 01 | urface Coating: Nor | meyer Flasks with 2000 mL, 64 oz., . per Case: 4, No. per | 98.68 | 197.36 |
| 22 | 1 | PK | | 312A Walter Stern E Diameter: 3 m Vendor Catalo This item is be List Price: | conomical Solid m g # 100C | S SOLID 3MM 1LB Glass Beads for Dis ber pack | | 16.20 | 16.20 |
| 23 | 1 | CS | 12 | lighting any fla Vendor Catalo | mmable gas | s Lighters, For Use each per case | With: Capable of | 55.04 | 55.04 |
| 24 | 2 | CS | 13 6 | Magnifier Strip mL, Green, Gr Vendor Catalo | terile Polystyrene be, Volume: 2 mL, raduations: 0.01 n | | gical Pipets with erance: +/-0.04 | 76.80 | 153.60 |
| 25 | 2 | CS | 13 6 | Magnifier Strip wrap, Tolerand Vendor Catalo | terile Polystyrene be, Volume: 25 ml ce: +/-0.5 mL, Re | | gical Pipets with ped, paper-plastic | 59.12 | 118.24 |



| escri | ntion | Unit | Extended | |
|-------|--------------|---------------------------|----------|--|
| | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD | 7 of 34 | |
| | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | Page | |

| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|---------------|-------------------|
| 26 | 1 | CS | Magnifier Str wrap, Tolera To Deliver/Bl Vendor Cata Shelf Life 3Y | log # 431030 | 22.81 | 22.81 |
| 27 | 1 | CS | Magnifier Str wrap, Tolera To Deliver/Bl Vendor Cata Shelf Life 3Y | log # 431031 | 23.89 | 23.89 |
| 28 | 1 | CS | Volume: 2.5r Multipette, Fo Style: Positiv Vendor Cata Shelf Life 5Y | CBT. ADVANCED 2.5ML STERL100CS ombitips Advanced Pipetter Tips - Standard, Sterile, nL, Color Code: Green, Compatibility: Eppendorf or Use With: Eppendorf Multipette, Graduated: Yes, Tip e Displacement, Extended Length log # 0030089553 peing sold as 100 each per case 216.00 CDC: 015 | 164.12 | 164.12 |
| 29 | 1 | EA | 6 in. (10 x 10 Included: Yes in., 10 cm | TEST TUBE BASKET 4X4X6IN Aluminum Baskets with Tilt-Top Lids, Dimensions: 4 x 4 x x 15.2cm), Autoclavable: Not Autoclavable, Closure s, Height: 6 in., 15.2 cm, Length: 4 in., 10 cm, Width: 4 log # 1380710 being sold as 1 per each 51.70 CDC: 007 | 33.01 | 33.01 |



| | | | | | | Part of Th | ermo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|---|--|--|---|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refer | ence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | 376-25 RD | 8 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | ption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 30 | 1 | EA | 6 in. (10 x 10 | Aluminum Baskets v x 15.2cm), Autocla , Height: 6 in., 15.2 og # 1380710 | vable: Not Autocla | | 33.01 | 33.01 |
| 31 | 1 | EA | (25 x 15 x 15. No, Height: 6 Vendor Catalo | 2cm), Autoclavable in., 15.2 cm, Lengt | without Lids, Dime e: Not Autoclavable th: 10 in., 25 cm, V | nsions: 10 x 6 x 6 in. e, Closure Included: Vidth: 6 in., 15 cm | 35.56 | 35.56 |
| 32 | 1 | РК | 510mm), Qua 610mm, Width keep spills fro Vendor Catalo | Absorbent Underpa Intity: 50 Pack, Abs | orbancy: 750mL/n For Use With: Quic ethylene | 4 x 20 in. (610 x | 27.83 | 27.83 |
| 33 | 1 | РК | Not Autoclava Dimensions: 4 in., 7.3 cm, Le in., 7.8 cm Vendor Catale | ienceware Microce | Tubes, Positions: . n. (11.9 x 7.8 x 7.3 9 cm, Quantity: 4/F | Rack, Autoclavable: 24, Microtube Rack, 3cm), Height: 2.93 | 39.00 | 39.00 |
| 34 | 1 | EA | Manufacturing White, For Us | ntific Nalgene Unwi g Technology, for 2 se With: 20mm Tub s, Acetal Plastic, Po | Omm tubes, white es, Autoclavable: | s: Resmer , Array: 4 x 10, Autoclavable, Holds: | 32.68 | 32.68 |



| | | | | | | Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific | ; |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|--|----------------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nb | r Custon | ner Reference | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346 | 81 RFQ REQTE | E 1028-1376-25 RD | 9 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | | ≇ 5970-0020 g sold as 1 per each 3.70 CDC: 017 | | | |
| 35 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientific Manufacturing Te For Use With: 30 Tubes, Acetal Pla Unwire Wht 30m Vendor Catalog # This item is being | RACK UNWIRE TEST TUBE c Nalgene Unwire Test Tube echnology, for 30mm tubes, w mm Tubes, Autoclavable: Au astic, Positions: 24, Descripti m, Diameter Opening: 30 mr # 5970-0030 g sold as 1 per each 7.60 CDC: 017 | Racks: Resmer vhite, Array: 3 x 8, W toclavable, Holds: 30 on: Test Tube Rack | | 38.7 |
| 36 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientific Manufacturing Te Orange, For Use 20 mm Tubes, Ac Rack Unwire Ora Vendor Catalog # This item is being | + | Racks: Resmer prange, Array: 4 x 10, vable: Autoclavable, H | Holds: | 2 32.0 |
| 37 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientific Manufacturing Te Orange, For Use 30 mm Tubes, Ad Rack Unwire Ora Vendor Catalog # This item is being | ± 5970-0130 | Racks: Resmer prange, Array: 3 x 8, vable: Autoclavable, H | | 2 41.2 |
| 38 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientific Manufacturing Te For Use With: 13 Tubes, Acetal Pla | | Racks: Resmer ed, Array: 6 x 12, Re toclavable, Holds: 13 on: Test Tube Rack | |) 20.3 |



52.48

26.32

21.77

98.21

| | | | | | Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific | | | |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | ence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-13 | 76-25 RD | 10 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | List Price: | 63.70 CDC: 017 | | | | |
| 39 | 1 | PK | Gauge: No No Yes, Length: Included, Rec Luer-lock Vendor Catalo Shelf Life 5Y | e Syringes with Lu eedle Included, Co No Needle Include commended Applic og # 309628 eing sold as 100 o 91.90 CDC: 013 | d, Needle Point Nu ations: Healthcare each per pack | ne: 1 mL, Needle er Tip, Disposable: | 52.48 | 52.4 |
| 40 | 1 | РК | Type: Luer Ti Applications: Vendor Catalo | e Syringes with Lu o, Disposable: Yes Healthcare, Sterile | , Latex Free: Yes, , Termination: Lue each per pack | ne: 3 mL, Connection Recommended | 26.32 | 26.3 |
| 41 | 1 | РК | Volume: 5 mL Yes, Recomm Luer-lock Vendor Catale Shelf Life 5Y | e Syringes with Lu , Connection Type hended Application og # 309646 eing sold as 125 o 36.35 CDC: 014 | e: Luer Tip, Dispos Is: Healthcare, Ste each per pack | Lok; Volume: 5mL, able: Yes, Latex Free: | 21.77 | 21.7 |
| 42 | 1 | CS | Red, For Use Yes, Polyprop Vendor Catalo This item is b | ences Kimble Kim- | plain-end culture t : Yes each per case | S losures, Closure Color: ubes, Autoclavable: | 98.21 | 98.21 |

156.20 CDC: 015 List Price:

Nbr



| | | | | | Part of Ther | mo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|----|--|---|--|---|----------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | nce | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 76-25 RD | 11 of 34 |
| Qty | UN | Catalog Num | nber Des | cription | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 1 | CS | x L: Clos Plair cher Ven This | TUBE CULT nerbrand Disposable Boros 13 x 100mm, Diameter Ou sure: KIM-KAP, Non-sterile in, Disposable: Yes, For Us mistry ndor Catalog # 60C14-961- s item is being sold as 100 Price: 139.70 CDC: 0 | uter: 13mm, Length: e, Autoclavable: Yes, se With: For tissue c -27 00 each per case | with Plain End, O.D. 100mm, Capacity: 10mL, Clear, Design Type: | 34.87 | 34.87 |
| 1 | CS | Vert in. (* Stor Ven This | 7F CRYBX RK S ermo Scientific CryoBox Fre tical, Holds: 9 CryoBoxes/F 14.3 x 14 x 50.2 cm), Silve rage Rack, Vertical, Quant ador Catalog # 5036-0009 s item is being sold as 4 Price: 1,814.00 CDC: 0 | Rack, Dimensions: 5 er, Stainless Steel, C ity: 4/cs. each per case | .3 x 22.5cm, Design: .625 x 5.5 x 19.75 | 627.22 | 627.22 |
| 1 | PK | Appl D52 Finis Yes, Ven She This List | A DERMAFREI Bell MICROFLEX Derma Fr Dications: Industrial, AQL: - 250, FDA 21 CFR 177.2600 sh: No Texture, Finger Thi s, Exam, Non-sterile ador Catalog # DF-850-S elf Life 5Y s item is being sold as 10 Price: 8.61 CDC: 17 duct - Non-Returnable | 1.5, Certifications/Co 0, EN 420:2003 + A1 ckness: 3.5 mil, 0.09 0 each per pack | ves, Size: Small, mpliance: ASTM :2009, Clear, Exterior | 4.92 | 4.92 |
| 1 | РК | grad Forc bag, Ven This | 4 HLT 2ML TU ermo Scientific Snap Cap L duated, Description: 2.0mL ce: 25000xG, Capacity: 2m a, 10 bags/ unit, 10 units/ ca ador Catalog # 3434 s item is being sold as 50 Price: 170.70 CDC: 0 | - Graduated, Nonster nL, Polypropylene, P ase, Non-sterile, Cap 0 each per pack | entrifuge Tubes, 2mL, rile, Natural, Max. ackaging: 50 tubes/ | 50.28 | 50.28 |



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | rence | Page |
|-----|-------|----|--|---|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | | 12 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 47 | 1 | CS | Volume:10u; (Needle, Flexik Quantity: 250/ Disposable: Y Vendor Catalo | Disposable Inocula Color: Yellow; Indir ble, Paper Peel Po /Cs., Volume: 10ul | vidual wrapped, Ind ouch, Individually w L, Diameter Inside: each per case | edles, Flexible Loop; oculating Loop and rapped, Packaging | 39.35 | 39.35 |
| 48 | 1 | CS | Inoculation Lo wrapped, Pac Inside: 0.035/0 Certificate of o Vendor Catalo | Disposable Inocula pop, Flexible, Natu kaging Quantity: 2 | each per case | edles, Combo uch, Individually /10uL, Diameter | 41.14 | 41.14 |
| 49 | 1 | CS | 76.2mm), Len in., Quantity: 2 Vendor Catalo | rile Gauze Sponge gth: 76.2mm, 3 in. 200 Bag, Non-ster og # 3124 eing sold as 4000 193.80 CDC: 038 | ile, Absorbancy: Si each per case | x 3 in. (76.2 x /, Width: 76.2mm, 3 | 74.70 | 74.70 |
| 50 | 1 | EA | 80 x 155. Flas the flask and 3 maximize oxy orbital shaker. plastic closure splashing that Vendor Catalo | 250mL, 6 Baffles, sk has 6 baffles, 3 3 baffles on the bo gen transfer to the . Delong style nec | baffles on the lowe ottom surface of the e culture medium w k is made to fit stai r neck reduces the closure. er each | e flask to hen used on an nless steel or | 41.19 | 41.19 |
| 51 | NOBIE |) | *NO BID* | | | | | |

. 1 \frown ...: .



38.97

67.94

30.27

| | | | | Sales Quotatio | n Fisher S | | fic |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-2 | 25 RD | 13 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 52 | 1 | EA | 2-hydroxypropa alkolave, harto 1.00 AU max. a 0.025 AU max. Vendor Catalog Hazardous Ma This item is bei | terial | -0, 2-propanol, cohol, avantine, ropanol, 1L, | 38.97 | 38.97 |
| 53 | 1 | EA | hydrogen chlor chlorhydrique, spirits of salt, h <-0.5ppb, 57 d Vendor Catalog Hazardous Ma This item is bei | terial | hloorwaterstof, toff, acide hloric acid, | 67.94 | 67.94 |
| 54 | 1 | EA | 1,2,3-trihydrox alcohol, glyceri glycerine, 500r 200-289-5, 160 Vendor Catalog This item is bei | GLYCEROL, 99+% (ASSAY) 500 %, C3H8O3, CAS Number-56-81-5, ypropane, 1,2,3-propanetriol, propar itol, trihydroxypropane, glycerol, osn nL, 635685, 182 deg.C (20mmHg), 4 0 deg.C (320 deg.F), 92.09, Warning g # A16205-AP ing sold as 1 per each | glycerin, ietriol, glycyl ioglyn, CHEBI:17754, 1.26, | 30.27 | 30.27 |

| 55 | 1 | EA | AC148930010 | ACETIC ACID GLACIAL 99% 1 LTR | 80.68 | 80.68 |
|----|---|----|---------------|---|-------|-------|
| | | | Acetic Acid, | 99.8%, C2H4O2, CAS Number-64-19-7, ethylic acid, acide | | |
| | | | acetique, eth | anoic acid, acetic acid, glacial, acetasol, vinegar | | |
| | | | acid, methar | ecarboxylic acid, glacial, essigsaeure, 1L, (neat), 0.1 | | |
| | | | max. at 260r | nm, 0.02 max. at 280nm, (neat) at 0nm, Vapor Pressure: | | |
| | | | 1.52kPa at 2 | 0 deg.C, 02, 96 | | |
| | | | Vendor Cata | log # 148930010 | | |
| | | | Hazardous N | <i>l</i> aterial | | |
| | | | Shelf Life 5Y | | | |
| | | | | | | |

34.55 CDC: 033

List Price:



| 56 1 57 1 58 2 | | | | | | Fisher Scientific | |
|--|-------|---|--|--|---|-------------------|-------------------|
| 56 1 57 1 58 2 | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | e | Page |
| 56 1 57 1 58 2 | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376- | 25 RD | 14 of 34 |
| 57 1 | ty UN | Catalog Number | Descri | ption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 57 1 | | This item is bein List Price: 9 | g sold as 1 pe 92.10 CDC: 033 | er each | | | |
| 58 2 | 1 EA | trizma, trometam tromethamine, 2 trisamine, tham, Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 3Y This item is bein | hyl)aminometha nol, tris hydroxyr -amino-2-hydrox tris base, 1kg # 167620010 | nethyl aminometh kymethyl propane- er each | NO3, CAS Number-77-86-1, ane, tris buffer, | 116.16 | 116.16 |
| | 1 EA | 500-038-2, 270 0 60.0 deg.C, 15, Bottle, TQ41000 <-0.5% (K.F.) Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein | ycol), CAS Numl deg.C, 12 to 16n 7688, MFCD017 000, TSCA, 300-4 # 418050010 | ng KOH/g, H(OCH 79615, Average N 450 mPa.s (20 de | EG, 1kg, white flakes, 2CH2)nOH, 55.0 deg.C to | 79.19 | 79.19 |
| 59 1 I | 2 EA | Format: Powder, Bottle, Grade: B Vendor Catalog This item is bein | ic Agar, Bacterio , For Use With: I acteriological # 443572500 | RIOLOGICAL GR logical grade, Qua Microbial media, P er each | intity: 250g, | 71.83 | 143.66 |
| | 1 EA | BMA50001 Lonza SeaKem I Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein List Price: 1 Product - Non-R | LE Agarose, Qua # 50001 g sold as 1 pe 07.00 CDC: 086 | er each | N EEO | 80.25 | 80.25 |
| 60 1 | 1 EA | BMA50843 Vendor Catalog | 10X TBE BUFF # 50843 | FER 1LT | | 60.49 | 60.49 |



| | | | | Γ | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | ence | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-13 | 376-25 RD | 15 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descrip | otion | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | | g sold as 1 pe 73.10 CDC: 083 | r each | | | |
| 61 | 1 | EA | Formulation: TA Loading Buffer, S Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate Shelf Life 6M This item is bein | E Buffer, 10X wit Storage Requirer # 50844 rial | Concentration: 10 | te, 0.01M EDTA, DNA | 85.39 | 85.39 |
| 62 | 1 | EA | C10H18N2Na2C Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is bein | 010, CAS Numbe # FLBP120-500 | d, Disodium Salt [| 0ihydrate, >-99.0%, | 102.44 | 102.44 |
| 63 | 1 | EA | BP1302 10 | ETHIDIUM BRO | OMIDE 10ML | | 62.81 | 62.81 |
| | | | Quantity: 10mL, Red, Grade: Mol Molecular Weigh Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is bein | Packaging: Clea lecular Biology, M nt: 394.316 # BP130210 | r Bottle, CAS: 123 Iolecular Formula | , Fisher BioReagents, 39-45-8, 7732-18-5, :: C21H20BrN3, | | |
| 64 | 1 | EA | BP168 500 | BORIC ACID 50 | | | 50.34 | 50.34 |
| | | | three elephant, h boron hydroxide Pressure: 2.7mb Gray, 0.001% m Vendor Catalog This item is bein | n3bo3, flea prufe, , orthoboric acid, par at 20 deg.C, > ax., White | , boracic acid, boı basilit b, borofax >-99 %, 0.005% n | - | | |



| | Part of Them | | | | | | | mo Fisher Scientific | | |
|-----|--------------|----|---|---|---|---|---------------|----------------------|--|--|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | ence | Page | | |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-13 | 76-25 RD | 16 of 34 | | |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price | | |
| 65 | 1 | EA | Dimethyl Sulfoxide, >- sulfinylbis, dmso, dem sulfoxide, demsodrox, 100mL, <-0.30 Absort 20 deg.C, >-99.7 % Vendor Catalog # BPI Shelf Life 2Y This item is being solo | 99.7%, C2 hasorb, din dimethyls bance Unit BP231-100 | nethyl sulphoxide, sulfoxide, dimexide s at 280nm, Vapor | ber-67-68-5, methane, demavet, dimethyl | 37.74 | 37.74 | | |
| 66 | 1 | EA | Fisher BioReagents R 1g (>-50U/mg), Forma Vendor Catalog # BP2 Hazardous Material Shelf Life 2Y This item is being solo | libonuclea at: Powder 25391 | , Source: Bovine p er each | Pancreas), Quantity: | 539.60 | 539.60 | | |
| 67 | 1 | EA | Tween80, CAS Numb Monooleate, Polysorb 0.0001% max., Gray, Test, 0.25% max., 15, Vendor Catalog # BPI This item is being solo | ate 80, 50 Amber, 0. 7703, HD 3P338-500 | 5-6, Polyoxyethyle 0mL, Vapor Press 0005% max., 1.08 PE Bottle, Liquid,) | ure: <1hPa at 20 deg.C, 0g/cm3, 65 to 80, Pass | 33.81 | 33.81 | | |
| 68 | 1 | EA | Sodium Chloride, >-99 rock salt, saline, pure chloride, common salt 440 deg.C, (Dry Basis CHEBI:26710, Gray, V Vendor Catalog # FLE This item is being solo | 9.0%, CINa k, sodium (t, salt, halit s) >99.5%, White 8P358-1 | chloride nacl, denc e, 1kg, Vapor Pres | lritis, sodium ssure: 1mmHg at | 45.86 | 45.86 | | |
| 69 | 1 | EA | Glycerol Gel-Loading | | | 1-5, 7732-18-5, 5mL, | 97.40 | 97.40 | | |

0.25 to 0.45 AU at 252nm, 0.30 to 0.45 AU, 0.25 to 0.40 AU, Gray,



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Referer | ce | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 6-25 RD | 17 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | Molecular Biolog Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 2Y This item is beir | gy, Contains 30 ^o # FLBP645 5 | % Glycerol, Poly Bo er each | s (<6%), and Water, ottle, Liquid, RT | | |
| 70 | 1 | EA | >-96 %, 1600 de Certified, WARN Vendor Catalog This item is beir | e, >-96%, CaCl eg.C, CHEBI:33 NNG! # FLC77-500 | 12, Gray, Beige, 2. er each | 043-52-4, 500g, 2% max., | 157.00 | 157.00 |
| 71 | 1 | EA | solution, anhydr anhydrous, d-gl 2r,3s,4r,5r-2,3,4 d-glucose in line Vendor Catalog This item is beir | ucose) Anhydrou ous dextrose, a ucose, anhydrou 5,6-pentahydro ear form, 500g, 0 # FLD16-500 | ldehydo-d-glucose us, glucosteril, d +- oxyhexanal, glucose CHEBI:42758 er each | Number-50-99-7, dextrose dextrose, glucose, | 20.07 | 20.07 |
| 72 | 1 | EA | Certifications/Co With: Cultivation Packaging: Bott Requirements: - Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 5Y This item is beir | Irated Culture M ompliance: AOA o of Mycobacteri le, Quantity: 500 <30 deg.C # 271310 | a, Media Type: Mic Og, Shelf Life: 1825 er each | 7H9 Broth, : Dehydrated, For Use Idlebrook 7H9 Broth, | 236.84 | 236.84 |
| 73 | 1 | CS | Raised Ridge, D | ri Dishes with C Diameter: 100mr Disure Included: Ieeves/Cs., 500 | n, Height: 15mm, F Yes, Edges: Raise | ge, Shape: Round, olystyrene, Closure | 53.10 | 53.10 |



| | | | | 1 | | | | |
|-----|-------|----|---|--|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refere | nce | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 76-25 RD | 18 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | ption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | | ng sold as 500 e 331.50 CDC: 031 | each per case | | | |
| 74 | 1 | EA | cicloheximide, neocyclohexim 200-636-0, 281 Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mat Shelf Life 1Y This item is bei | kaken, naramycin ide, actidone, acti .35, YPHMISFOF g # 0210018301 terial | AS Number-66-81 a, hizarocin, cyclo | CHEBI:27641, White, | 81.57 | 81.5 |
| 75 | 1 | EA | 20mg, Concent Source: Bovine Use With: Used Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 1Y This item is bei | s Deoxyribonucle ration: >-2,000KL pancreas, Storag d as a genetic ma g # 0210057520 | J/mg, Format: Lyo ge Requirements: rker for forensic id er each | Pancreas, Quantity: philized Powder, 4 deg.C, White, For | 317.28 | 317.28 |
| 76 | 1 | EA | | minimum order o POURITE TM AN 9 # 8-500 | NTI-BUBBLE ADI juantity of 3 per su TI-BUBBLE ADDT | pplier | 74.33 | 74.3 |
| 77 | NOBID | | *NO BID* | | | | | |
| 78 | 1 | EA | Purifies linear a 100mL Wizard Syringe barrels Vendor Catalog This item is bei | rd DNA Cleanup S and circular DNA f DNA cleanup res , Storage Require g # A7280 | from 200 to 50,000 in, 100 Wizard mir ements: 15 to 30 d er each | 100 Preps, For Use With: bp, Includes: iicolumns, 100 3cc | 193.19 | 193.19 |



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Referen | ce | Page |
|-----|-----|----|---|--|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376 | 6-25 RD | 19 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 79 | 1 | EA | QKNYBSVHEM 2-amino-2-(hydi 93573, 15 to 30 Vendor Catalog Shelf Life 1Y This item is beir | OAJP-UHFFFA0 roxymethyl)propa deg.C, C(C(CO) # H5123 | umber-1185-53-1, DYSA-N, ane-1,3-diol;hydrod)(CO)N)O.Cl er each | 500g, 157.56, Molecular, shloride, 157.594, | 140.16 | 6 140.16 |
| 80 | 1 | EA | Number-6131-9 acetate tn, natri acetic acid, sod acetate usan:jai Vendor Catalog This item is beir | 0-4, plasmafusir um acetate-3-wa ium salt, trihydra n, thomaegelin, t |) to 101.0%, C2H9 a, sodium acetate t asser, tutofusin, un te, sodium acetate 500g er each | rihydrate, sodium ii-4550k0sc9b, | 49.34 | 4 49.34 |
| 81 | 1 | EA | soda, caustic, s caustic soda, so sodium hydroxid deg.C, >-97.0 % Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is beir | ide, >-97.0%, HN odium hydrate, a odium hydroxide de, white caustic 6, 1390 deg.C # FLS318-100 erial | scarite, soda lye, a na oh, sodium hyc | -1310-73-2, 497-19-8, aetznatron, | 27.84 | 4 27.84 |
| 82 | 1 | EA | Use With: Provi 8.75 in., 22.9 cm Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is beir | des up to 5 hour n, Recommende # 65 erial | | - | 52.73 | 3 52.73 |

Nbr

83

Qty

1

84 NOBID

85 NOBID

87 NOBID

NOBID

86

UN

ΕA

-



| | | Sales | | | Fisher Scientific Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific | | |
|---|---|--|------------------------------|--------------------|--|-------------------|--|
| | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Referer | nce | Page | |
| | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 6-25 RD | 20 of 34 | |
| (| Catalog Number | Descri | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price | |
| | butane fuel, B Vendor Catalo Hazardous Ma | d LPG Burner Buta urner, LPG, Recor og # 65F | mmended Applicati er each | With: Replacement | 15.98 | 15.98 | |
| | *NO BID* | 02 717 350 | | | | | |
| | *NO BID* | 02 717 352 | | | | | |
| | *NO BID* | 02 717 351 | | | | | |
| | *NO BID* | 19 005 427 | | | | | |

| 88 | 1 | ΡK | 09 924 120 | 589/3 CIRCLES 125MM 100/PK | 65.89 | 65.89 |
|----|---|----|----------------|--|-------|-------|
| | | | Cytiva Whatr | nan Grade 589/3 Quantitative Filter Paper Circles, | | |
| | | | Diameter: 12 | 5mm, Format: Circle, Grade: 589/3, High-quality cotton | | |
| | | | linters, Ashle | ss Quantitative Filter Paper, Basis Weight: 84g/m2, | | |
| | | | Filtration Spe | ed: 375 sec., Particle Retention: Very fine, Quantity: | | |
| | | | 100Pack, Th | ckness: 160um | | |
| | | | Vendor Cata | og # 10300211 | | |
| | | | This item is b | eing sold as 100 each per pack | | |
| | | | List Price: | 85.20 CDC: 014 | | |
| | | | | | | |

| 89 | 1 | EA | 13 374 10 | PARAFILM 4 IN X 125 FT/RL | 71.70 | 71.70 |
|----|---|--|---|--|-------|-------|
| | | are and a second s | Length: 125 cost-effective and caps, an instruments., Vendor Cata | Im M Laboratory Wrapping Film, Width: 4 in., 10 cm, ft., 38 m, Sealing Film, Applications: Efficient and a covering, over wrap to further secure stoppers, lids, d shelf or tray liner to prevent slipping of bottles or Thermoplastic log # PM996 being sold as 1 per each 119.50 CDC: 018 | | |
| 90 | 1 | EA | BP2818500 | MOLECULAR BIOLOGY GRADE ETHANO | 34.61 | 34.61 |
| | | | algrain, ethyl | 9.5%, C2H6O, CAS Number-64-17-5, ethyl hydroxide, alcohol, alkohol, methylcarbinol, ethyl hydrate, grain ol, alcohol, anhydrol, 500mL, Pass Test, Assay: >-99.5% | | |

(v/v), 2ppm max., 78 deg.C, CHEBI:16236, Red, Colorless Vendor Catalog # BP2818-500



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | e | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|--|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | 2 | 152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376- | 25 RD | 21 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descriptio | on | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | Hazardous Materi This item is being List Price: 97 | | ach | | | |
| 91 | 1 | EA | Magnesium Chlor 7791-18-6, magne anhydrous, magne dichloride, magne max., >-99.0 %, 0 Vendor Catalog # This item is being | esium chloride anł esiumchlorid, mag sium chloride, mg 0.01% max. | >-99.0%, Cl2M hydrous, magne nesium ii chlor cl2, chloromag | g, CAS Number-7786-30-3, | 64.95 | 64.95 |
| 92 | 1 | EA | | AGAR GRANULA akes, Fisher BioR | | | 152.46 | 152.46 |
| | | | Quantity: 500g, Fo solidifying agent f Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being | ormat: Powder to or culture media, 0 BP1423500 | Flakes, For Use Grade: Molecul | With: Used for a | | |
| 93 | 1 | EA | Fisher BioReager Poly Bottle, Quan in a form readily a Molecular genetic Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y This item is being | tity: 500g, Format: available to bacteri s | edia Additives: Powder, For L a, Media Type: | Peptone, Packaging: Ise With: Nitrogen Peptone, Grade: | 62.35 | 62.35 |
| 94 | 1 | EA | | ORTEX MIXER A | | | 202.70 | 202.70 |
| | | | 120V, Amperage: Exterior: 7.97 in., Exterior: 4.75 in., (20.2 x 12.1 x 12.) Vendor Catalog # This item is being | | Exterior: 5 in., Weight: 10 lb., ns Exterior: 7.§ | 12.7cm, Length 4.5kg, Width | | |



| | | | | | | | Termo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|--|---|-------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | rence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | 376-25 RD | 22 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 95 | 1 | EA | 1.5/2 mL, 10 x Product Line: F 15 A, Certificat Drive System: Vendor Catalo This item is be | htrifuge 5425, Con 5 mL, Max. RCF Frontier 5000 Ser ions/Compliance | ies Mini, Refrigerat : UL and cUL, Dep er each | ad, Capacity: 24 x Speed: 15,060 rpm, ed: No, Amperage: | 2,332.40 | 2,332.40 |
| 96 | 1 | EA | 3%, Volume: 2 Autoclavable, 0 Ergonomic, Ind Vendor Catalo This item is be | ite Adjustable-Vo to 20 uL, Increm Compatible Tips: cludes: Calibration g # 4680030 | ents: 0.02uL, Auto SureOneTM tips, F n certificate, in-lab er each | inger Style: | 161.08 | 161.08 |
| 97 | 1 | EA | 0.6 to 1.8%, Vo Autoclavable, 0 | ite Adjustable-Vo blume: 20 to 200 Compatible Tips: cludes: Calibration g # 4680060 | D ELITE 20-200UL olume Pipettors, 20- uL, Increments: 0.2 SureOneTM tips, F n certificate, in-lab er each | 200uL, Accuracy: 2uL, Autoclavable: Finger Style: | 174.48 | 174.48 |
| 98 | 1 | EA | For Use With: Vendor Catalo | enceware Pipette | ce: Acid and Alkali er each | sreen, Volume: 10 mL, | 31.47 | 31.47 |
| 99 | 1 | CS | Mouth: Narrow Borosilicate Gl Material: Polyp | ble Media Storag , Quantity: 10/Cs ass, Non-sterile, | ••• | r: 3.3 oz., 100 mL, 45, Orange, | 55.08 | 55.08 |



| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | 9 | Page |
|-----|-----|----|---|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-2 | 25 RD | 23 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | | # 1395-100 g sold as 10 each per case 37.00 CDC: 063 | | | |
| 100 | 1 | CS | Capacity: 3.3 oz to 80mL, Height: Non-sterile, Clos Closure Type: S Vendor Catalog This item is bein | | ap, Capacity: 100mL, n, Graduations: 20 .45, Natural, | 57.36 | 57.36 |
| 101 | 1 | CS | 06 414 1B | BTL MEDIA PYREX 250ML 10/C e Media Storage Bottles, 250mL (| | 61.99 | 61.9 |
| | | | Orange, Borosili Closure Material 2.7 in., 70mm Vendor Catalog This item is bein | uth: Wide, Quantity: 10/Cs., Closu cate Glass, Non-sterile, Closure C : Polypropylene, Closure Type: So # 1395-250 g sold as 10 each per case 52.70 CDC: 063 | color: Orange, | | |
| 102 | 1 | CS | FB800250 | MEDIA BTL GS GL45 250 ML 10 | | 63.66 | 63.60 |
| | | | Capacity: 8.45 o to 200mL, Heigh Non-sterile, Clos Closure Type: S Vendor Catalog This item is bein | | ım, Graduations: 50 BL45, Natural, | | |
| 103 | 1 | CS | 06 414 1C | BTL MEDIA PYREX 500ML 10/C | | 75.00 | 75.00 |
| | | | Mouth: Wide, Qu Borosilicate Glas Material: Polypro 86mm, Graduat Vendor Catalog | e Media Storage Bottles, Capacity uantity: 10/Cs., Closure Size: GL4 ss, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Ora opylene, Closure Type: Screw Cap ions: 100 to 400 mL # 1395-500 g sold as 10 each per case | 5, Orange, Inge, Closure | | |



Quote Nbr Page **Customer Reference** RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2152-1346-81 24 of 34 Extended Unit UN Nbr Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price 180.70 CDC: 063 List Price: 104 1 CS FB800500 MEDIA BTL GS GL45 500 ML 10/CS 71.82 71.82 Fisherbrand Reusable Glass Media Bottles with Cap, Capacity: 500mL, Capacity: 17 oz., 500 mL, Diameter: 3.3 in., 86mm, Graduations: 100 to 400mL, Height: 6.9 in., 176mm, Closure Size: GL45, Natural, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Blue, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Screw Vendor Catalog # FS14395-500 This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 119.70 CDC: 018 CS 06 414 1D **BTL MEDIA PYREX 1L 10/CS** 105 1 91.27 91.27 PYREX Reusable Media Storage Bottles, 1L, Capacity: 33.8 oz., 1000 mL, 1 L, Mouth: Narrow, Quantity: 10/Cs., Closure Size: GL45, Orange, Borosilicate Glass, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Orange, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Plug Seal, Diameter: 3.9 in., 101 mm Vendor Catalog # 1395-1L This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 222.50 CDC: 063 106 CS FB8001000 MEDIA BTL GS GL45 1000ML 10/CS 94.50 94.50 1 Fisherbrand Reusable Glass Media Bottles with Cap, Capacity: 1000mL, Capacity: 33.8 oz., 1000 mL, Diameter: 3.9 in., 101mm, Graduations: 100 to 900mL, Height: 8.8 in., 225mm, Closure Size: GL45, Natural, Non-sterile, Closure Color: Blue, Closure Material: Polypropylene, Closure Type: Screw Vendor Catalog # FS14395-1000 This item is being sold as 10 each per case List Price: 157.50 CDC: 018 107 1 CS 02 555 2 **BEAKR STARTER PACK NO1 1/CS** 37.78 37.78 DWK Life Sciences Kimble KIMAX Low Form, Griffin, Starter Pack, Capacity: 50 mL, 100 mL, 250 mL, 600 mL, and 1000 mL, Borosilicate Glass, Accuracy: +/-5%, Certifications/Compliance: USP, ASTM E438 Vendor Catalog # 14080-01 This item is being sold as 1 per case

List Price: 56.60 CDC: 062



| | | | | | Part of Thermo Fish | er Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 | RD | 25 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number Dese | cription | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 108 | 1 | EA | 14 513 61STIR BAR OFisherbrand Octagon Spinbarin., 8mm, Length: 2 in., 50.8mDimensions: 2 x 0.31 in. (50.8Octagonal, Certifications/ComQuantity: 50, Stir bar, Width: 0Vendor Catalog # 37110-5002This item is being sold as 1List Price:12.75 CDC: 02 | m, Autoclavable: Yes x 8mm), Alnico Mag pliance: ISO 9001:20 .31 in., 8mm per each | ırs, Diameter: 0.31 s, White, net, Shape: | 6.91 | 6.91 |
| 109 | 1 | EA | 01 912 407 ME1002E 12 Mettler Toledo NewClassic ME Capacity: 1200 g, Readability: Certifications/Compliance: ISC Type: Backlit LCD, Electrical F Vendor Catalog # 30029122 This item is being sold as 1 List Price: 1,485.00 CDC: 0 | E Precision Balances 0.01 g, Stabilization 0/GLP, Connection T Requirements: 100/2 per each | s, Model: ME1002E, Time: 1 sec., ype: RS-232, Display | 1,039.50 | 1,039.50 |
| 110 | 1 | PK | 75 003 839 ADPT PRP B | UFFY COAT BAG P | K/2 | 218.79 | 218.79 |
| | | | Thermo Scientific 250mL Plate Adapter for Oval Single Blood Platelet-rich Plasma or Buffy C 6/8 x 250mL, For Use With: O Vendor Catalog # 75003839 This item is being sold as 2 List Price: 280.50 CDC: 0 | Bag Buckets, Descr Coat Bag Adapter (se val single blood bag each per pack | iption: 250mL et of 2), Capacity: | | |
| 111 | 1 | EA | | 4 W UNIV. PLAT EA | | 6,830.92 | 6,830.92 |
| | | | Eppendorf Scientific Excella E Shakers Package, Model: Exc deg.F, 7 to 60 deg.C, Length F in., Voltage: 120/100V, Width Universal platform Vendor Catalog # M1352-0010 This item is being sold as 1 List Price: 7,866.00 CDC: S | ella E24, Temperatu Platform: 18 in., 45.7 Platform: 18 in., 45.7 D per each | re Range: 44.6 to 140 2cm, Orbit: 0.75 | | |



| | | | | | | Part of I | hermo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-----|----|--|--|--|---|-------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | erence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | 1376-25 RD | 26 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 112 | 1 | EA | Fisherbrand Isote Block, Electrical Steel, Relative H to 130 deg.C, Ce Type: PID Vendor Catalog a This item is being | emp Digital Dry Requirements: umidity: <80%, ertifications/Com # 88860021 | 100/120 V, 50/60 H Temperature Rang opliance: CE, cULu er each | 20V ers, No. of Places: 1 Hz, Powder-coated ge: Ambient +5 deg.C is, RoHS, Controller | 312.37 | 312.37 |
| 113 | 1 | EA | Corning LSE Dig Ambient +5 deg. Chamber: 6.7 in. Bath, Dimension in.) (12.9 in. w/co Vendor Catalog This item is being | ital Water Bath, to 99 deg.C, Co , 17 cm Chamb s: 29 x 38 x 23 o over) # 6783 | ontroller Type: PID er, Depth: 29 cm, I cm (33 cm w/cover er each | Temperature Range: | 756.97 | 756.97 |
| 114 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientifia Description: Sing Electrical Require ft., Chamber Mat Humidity: >90% Vendor Catalog This item is being List Price: 11,7 Medical Device Product - Non-Re | le 150L incubat ements: 120 V, erial: Electropol at 37 deg.C # 51026406 g sold as 1 pe 760.00 CDC: 99 eturnable | CO2 Incubator, IR tor, CO2 Sensor To 50/60 Hz, Capacit lished Stainless St er each 99 | echnology: IR sensor, y: 150 L, 5.3 cu. | 10,161.95 | 10,161.95 |
| | | | 13 762 722 E | XTENDED WA | r purchase below: RRANTY INCUBA | TOR \$1218.00 | == | |
| 115 | 1 | EA | | | MULTIDOC-IT/M-: | 20 ging System (3 door), | 6,510.20 | 6,510.20 |
| | | | | M-20, Voltage: ling, Wavelengt # 97-0192-04 | 115V, For Use Wi | th: Fluorescent and | | |



| | | | | | | Part of I | hermo Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-------|----|---|--|---|---|-------------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | erence | Page |
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028- | 1376-25 RD | 27 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descri | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | List Price: | 7,570.00 CDC: 01 | 0 | | | |
| 116 | 1 | EA | Cord Vendor Ca This item List Price: Extended 70 168 1 70 105 6 | atalog # 840-281700 is being sold as 1 pe 2,790.00 CDC: 01 d warranty available fo 700 SPECTRONIC 239 UNITY BASIC E | 200; Thermo Scier er each 0 r purchase below: 200 EXTENDED V DEPOT WAR SPE | | | 2,257.1 |
| 117 | 1 | EA | Amperage Use With: CSA, Dim LED Vendor Ca | nd Electrophoresis Por 2 400 mA, Voltage: 30 SDS-PAGE, DGGE/C ensions: 10.25 x 5.5 x atalog # FB300Q is being sold as 1 po | 0 V, Electrical Rec DGE and DNA/RN 5.25 in. (26 x 14 > | uirements: 120 V, For IA, | 522.16 | 522.1 |
| 118 | 1 | EA | Descriptio 38 x 11cm 14.94 x 4. 13.75 in., Vendor Ca | cientific Owl A6 Wide n: Gel size: 23 x 25cm I, Certifications/Compl 38 in. (35 x 38 x 11 cn 35 cm atalog # A6 is being sold as 1 pe | n; Buffer volume: 3 iance: CE marked n), Height: 4.38 in. er each | ctrophoresis System, L; L x W x H: 35 x , Dimensions: 13.75 x | 959.80 | 959.8 |
| 119 | NOBID |) | *NO BID* | | | | | |
| 120 | 1 | EA | Capacity: Amperage Rear, Cert | THERMOSCI 5 cientific Value Lab Und 5 cu. ft., 141.6 L, Elec 2: 1.1 A, Casters: 2 Ad tifications/Compliance Defrost: Manual | trical Requirement justable Feet In Fr | s: 115 V 60 Hz, ont, 2 Fixed Pads In | 1,605.60 | 1,605.6 |



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Refe | erence | Page |
|-----|-----|----|---|--|---|---------------------------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1 | 376-25 RD | 28 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | Hazardous Ma This item is be List Price: | eing sold as 1 p 2,230.00 CDC: 01 | | | | |
| | | | Extended wa 14 259 180 70 105 6239 | rranty available fo EXTENDED WA UNITY BASIC [| or purchase below: \RRANTY BASIC L DEPOT WAR SPE(| .R/F \$723.00 | | |
| 121 | 1 | EA | | e pre-made and re Other percentages og # 224004 | TATE SOL 4% 100 ady to use solutior are avaialble upon | n for making your | 80.40 | 80.4 |
| 122 | 1 | EA | Plate Width: 7 2500rpm, Volt 13.3 x 11.1cm in., 11.1cm, H Vendor Catalo | lagnetic Stirrers, T in., 17.8cm, Capa age: 120V, Dimen), Electrical Requi ertz: 60Hz | | n, Speed: 250 to x 4.375 in. (21 x | 243.03 | 243.0 |
| 123 | 1 | EA | Grade, protea Lyophilized Po Regulatory Sta | tific Albumin, Bovi se and enzyme-fre owder, Formulation atus: RUO, EINEC og # J65731-22 | ee, pH 7.0, Quantit n: Lyophilized pow CS Number: 232-93 er each | V, 98%, Immunoassay | 213.74 | 213.7 |
| 124 | 1 | EA | of Places: 18, Digital and To Includes: 1.5 r | nerbrand Isotemp Aluminum Alloy, F | | llock Heaters, No. | 75.69 | 75.69 |

Nbr

125

126

127

128



Quote Nbr **Customer Reference** Page RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD 2152-1346-81 29 of 34 Extended Unit UN Qty **Catalog Number** Description Price Price This item is being sold as 1 per each 106.70 CDC: 005 List Price: 05 400 008 24-PL A-T ROTOR+LID F/ 5424 ΕA 949.42 949.42 1 Eppendorf Model 5424 Microcentrifuge Rotors, Standard Rotor, Includes: Aerosol-tight lid, Capacity: 24 x 1.5/2mL, For Use With: 5430 Microcentrifuge, Max. RCF: 21,130 x g, Max. Speed: 15,000rpm, Angle: Fixed, No. of Places: 24, Radius: 8.4cm Vendor Catalog # 022653008 This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 1,384.00 CDC: 011 ΕA BP1422 500 YEAST EXTRACT DEHYDRATED 500G 116.87 116.87 1 Fisher BioReagents Microbiology Media Additives: Yeast Extract, Quantity: 500g, Format: Dehydrated, Media Type: Yeast Extract, Packaging: Poly Bottle, Description: Bacterial Culture, Grade: Molecular genetics Vendor Catalog # BP1422500 Shelf Life 3Y This item is being sold as 1 per each List Price: 185.50 CDC: 081 02 202 101 WEIGH BOATS MEDIUM 500/PK 34.91 1 PK 34.91 Fisherbrand Hexagonal Polystyrene Weighing Dishes, Depth: 15 mm, Diameter Inner Base: 47 mm, Diameter Inner Top: 67 mm, Weight: 1.4 g, For Use With: Design provides greater balance, protection and safety, Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 02202101 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack List Price: 127.50 CDC: 021 02 202 103 1 PK WEIGH BOATS XLG 500/PK 114.17 114.17 Fisherbrand Hexagonal Polystyrene Weighing Dishes, Depth: 32 mm, Diameter Inner Base: 92 mm, Diameter Inner Top: 132 mm, Weight: 7.1 g, For Use With: Design provides greater balance, protection and safety, Shape: Hexagonal Vendor Catalog # 02202103 This item is being sold as 500 each per pack List Price: 488.50 CDC: 021



| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Ref | erence | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | 2152-1346-8 | | | 30 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | - | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| 129 | 1 | EA | cm Vendor Cata | NATURAL GAS BUNSEN BUI n Burners, Basic, Description: Bas log # CH0991NG/RSD being sold as 1 per each 57.10 CDC: 013 | | 22.63 | 22.63 |
| 130 | 1 | CS | mL, Borosilic Baffled, Dian Vendor Cata | FLASK BAFFLED 250ML 6/Ci iences Kimble KIMAX Baffled Cult ate Glass, Autoclavable: Autoclava neter Outer: 1.5 in., 38 mm log # 25630-250 peing sold as 6 each per case 260.00 CDC: 064 | ure Flasks, Capacity: 250 | 143.00 | 143.00 |
| 131 | 1 | CS | mL, Borosilic Baffled, Dian Vendor Cata | FLASK BAFFLED 1000ML 6/0 iences Kimble KIMAX Baffled Cult ate Glass, Autoclavable: Autoclava neter Outer: 1.5 in., 3.8 cm log # 25630-1000 being sold as 6 each per case 464.50 CDC: 064 | ure Flasks, Capacity: 1000 | 255.48 | 255.48 |
| 132 | 1 | CS | Closure Colo Polypropylen Disposable: I mLess necks Vendor Cata | CLOSURE DSP PP NAT 38M propylene Flask Closures, Diameter r: Natural, Autoclavable: Autoclava e, Closure Type: Closure, Diameter No, For Use With: Culture tubes ar s, No. per Case: 100/Cs. log # 26797-38 being sold as 100 each per case 340.00 CDC: 063 | er Outer Neck: 3.8 cm, able, Closure Material: er Outer: 38 mm, | 210.80 | 210.80 |
| 133 | 1 | EA | Includes: PR verification su Power Cable Vendor Cata This item is the List Price: | NANODROP ONE SPECTRO ntific NanoDrop One Microvolume -1 pedestal conditioning solution, I olution, USB memory device, Micro , Warranty: 2 year log # 840-274100 being sold as 1 per each 12,150.00 CDC: 999 | UV-Vis Spectrophotomete PV-1 performance ofiber screen wipe, USA | | 12,150.00 |



| | | | | | - | | |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|--|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | ; | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-2 | 25 RD | 31 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | 70 105 8111 N 70 105 8112 N 70 105 8108 N | nty available for purchase below: VANODROP ONE/ONEC OQ RE VANODROP DIGITAL SIGN SW VANODROP ONE/ONEC VALID | CERT \$2780.00 OQ \$962.50 INSTAL \$3960.00 | | |
| 134 | 1 | EA | Magnesium Sulfa acid magnesium su ot, magnesium su sulfate 1:1, magn max., CHEBI:325 Vendor Catalog # This item is being | • | nber-7487-88-9, sulfuric Il angalis, tomix Ilfate, magnesium | 71.91 | 71.9′ |
| 135 | 1 | EA | Thermo Scientific 1mL, Concentrati Vendor Catalog # Hazardous Mater Shelf Life 4Y This item is being | ial | | 59.94 | 59.94 |
| 136 | 1 | CS | CELLTREAT Scie Bio-reaction tubes scale, high densit reaction application maintained throug screening and op parameters can be maximizing the masimultaneously. It seeding larger bio for larger bioreact graduations and a non-pyrogenic. Mainteened | - | n Tube Self Standing. ical option for small or biological otic conditions nembrane. Useful in the on cells. Reaction of materials, at can be performed pacterial growth, ting procedures ead black se/DNase free and ase is printed with | 147.80 | 147.80 |



| | | | | | | no Fisher Scientific | |
|-----|-------|----|--|---|---|----------------------|-------------------|
| | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Referer | nce | Page |
| | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-137 | 6-25 RD | 32 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | JN Catalog Number Descript | Description | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | - | g sold as 100 each per case 36.00 CDC: 053 | | | |
| 137 | 1 | EA | Kanamycin Sulfa White, Pass Test OOYGSFOGFJD Vendor Catalog # This item is being | KANAMYCIN MONO SULFATE te, C18H38N4O15S, CAS Numb , >250 deg.C, 582.58, < 1.0%, DHP-IZQIRFRQSA-N # FLBP906-5 g sold as 1 per each 9.70 CDC: 081 | | 62.81 | 62.81 |
| 138 | 1 | EA | Anhydrotetracycli inducer of the tetr vectors pASK-IB/ activity within our Vendor Catalog # Hazardous Mater | | and an efficient coli expression | 155.87 | 155.87 |
| 139 | 1 | EA | Fisher BioReager 500g, Format: De casein is used as Tryptone, Packag Grade: Molecular Vendor Catalog # Shelf Life 3Y | ≠ BP1421500 g sold as 1 per each | Pancreatic digest of ledia Type: | 136.40 | 136.40 |
| 140 | NOBIE |) | *NO BID* | | | | |
| 141 | 1 | EA | Simply add the sp to the gel slice co transfer to the su for organic denat Fast-Spin column minutes. DNA pu | ZYMOCLEAN GEL DNA KIT 50F pecially formulated Agarose Diss ontaining your DNA sample, let di pplied Zymo-Spin™ Columr urants or chloroform. Instead, the n technology to yield high-quality rified using the Zymoclean™ I for use in DNA ligation reactions ctions, PCR, etc. | olving Buffer (ADB) ssolve, and then h. There is no need e product utilizes DNA in just 15 e; Gel DNA Recovery Kit | 82.40 | 82.40 |



| | | | | | Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | | Page |
|-----|-----|----|--|---|--|---|---------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376- | -25 RD | 33 of 34 |
| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Descr | iption | | Unit Price | Extended Price |
| | | | Vendor Catalog List Price: 9 | # D4001 2.00 CDC: 053 | | | | |
| 142 | 1 | EA | 2225532, CHEB Statement H WIIZWVCIJKGZ 2,2-dichloro-N-[(Vendor Catalog This item is bein | I, >-99%, C11H I:17698, 200-28 350-H361, P20 OK-RKDXNWH 1R,2R)-1,3-dihy # B20841-14 | 87-4, 323.14, H350 1-P202-P281-P308 IRSA-N, /droxy-1-(4-nitroph er each | Number-56-75-7, 25g, 0.99, , GHS H | 47.57 | 47.57 |
| 143 | 1 | PK | NC0492929 | ELECTROPOR | RATION CUVETT1 | MM 50P | 93.00 | 93.00 |
| | | | gap size, 50 indi Vendor Catalog | vidually sealed | cuvettes, sterile | ation cuvettes, 1 mm | | |
| 144 | 1 | EA | alkaline lysis sys resuspension ste procedures. Sim directly to your b Zymo-Spin colur buffers included cell lysis and neu fastest and easie Coli efficiently. T and well suited for restriction endon sequencing, and Vendor Catalog Hazardous Mate This item is bein | nid Miniprep Kit tem that bypass aps common to ply add the unic acterial culture, nn technology. in the kit allow f utralization. The est method avai he plasmid DN/ or use in transfe uclease digestion other sensitive # D4020 rial | A is high quality, er ection, bacterial tra on, DNA ligation, F downstream appli er each | ree modified -pelleting and oreparation K Lysis Buffer en purify with atented colored on of complete iniprep Kit is the lasmid DNA from E. ndotoxin-free, nsformation, PCR, transcription, | 335.70 | 335.70 |



Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

| Quote Nbr | Customer Reference | Page | |
|--------------|---------------------------|----------|--|
| 2152-1346-81 | RFQ REQTE 1028-1376-25 RD | 34 of 34 | |

| Nbr | Qty | UN | Catalog Number | Description | Unit Price | Extended Price |
|-----|-----|----|---|---|---------------|---|
| 145 | 1 | EA | sequencing- formulated D to the supplie denaturants column techr in just 2 minu sequencing, | DNA CLEAN AND CONC-25 200 PREP e used for post-RT cDNA clean-up and purification of ready DNA from M13 phage. Simply add the specially NA Binding Buffer to your sample and transfer the mixture ed Zymo-Spin™ Column. There is no need for organic or chloroform. Instead, the product features ZymoSpin hology to yield DNA that is free of salts and contaminants utes. The purified DNA is ideal for DNA ligation, labeling, PCR, microarray, transfection, transformation, in digestion procedures. log # D4006 294.00 CDC: 053 | 244.90 | 244.90 |
| 146 | 1 | EA | miroscopy. 1 atitrantin stro forms an inso are water-so | • | 51.60 | 51.60 |
| | | | Conta Haza | CHANDISE TOTAL ainer/Ice Charges rdous Material Charge ack Fee AL | | 58,356.82 33.00 34.00 12.00 58,435.82 |

NOTES:

Returns are subject to manufacturer terms and conditions.

We now offer highly competitive financing with low monthly payments. Please contact your local sales representative for more information.

Tell us about your recent customer service experience by completing a short survey. This should take no longer than three minutes. Enter the link into your browser and enter the passcode: USA-PGH-CS2 http://survey.medallia.com/fishersci